
A G E N D A 
SILOAM SPRINGS BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

JANUARY 19, 2016 
BOARD MEETING - 6:30 PM 

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING, 400 N. BROADWAY 

Regular Board of Directors Meeting: 
Opening of Regularly Scheduled Meeting 
Call to Order 
Roll Call 
Prayer 
Pledge of Allegiance  
Approval of Minutes 
Regular Meeting of January 5, 2016 

I. Public Input 
Items from the Public not on the Agenda (public may address any City business not listed on the 
agenda) 

II. Regularly Scheduled Items
Contracts and Approvals
A. BKD, LLC Auditors
B. Change Order / Library / Sidewalk on Mt. Olive
Ordinances
C. Ordinance 15-31 / 1st Reading / 2015 International Property Maintenance Code
D. Ordinance 15-32 / 2nd Reading / Amending Municipal Code Section 94-127 / Unlicensed and

Inoperable Vehicles  
E. Ordinance 16-01 / 2nd Reading / Amending Chapter 6 of the Code of Ordinances / Alcoholic 

Beverages 
F. Ordinance 16-02 / 1st Reading / Amend Article VI, Division 1 of the Municipal Code / 

Preference Among Municipal Bidders 
G. Ordinance. 16-03  / 1st Reading / Amending Section 74-72 of the Municipal Code to revise the 

Family Aquatic Center rates 
Resolutions 
H. Resolution 03-16 / Referendum on City Contributions of Social Security for Part Time 

Employees 
Staff Reports 

Administrator’s Report 
III. Directors Reports
IV. Adjournment



MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF 
THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE 

CITY OF SILOAM SPRINGS, BENTON COUNTY, 
ARKANSAS, HELD JANUARY 5, 2016 

The Board of Directors of the City of Siloam Springs, Arkansas, met in regular session at the City of 
Siloam Springs Administration Building, on January 5, 2016. 

The Meeting was called to order by Mayor Turner. 

Roll Call: Beers, Burns, Johnson, Smith, Jones, Smiley, Coleman - Present 

Phillip Patterson, City Administrator; Jay Williams, City Attorney; Renea Ellis, City Clerk; James 
Wilmeth, Police Chief; Greg Neely, Fire Chief; Justin Bland, City Engineer; Ben Rhoads, Senior Planner; 
all present. 

Opening prayer was led by Bob Coleman. 

Mayor John Turner led the Pledge of Allegiance. 

A copy of the December 15, 2015, minutes of the regular meeting had previously been given to each 
Director. A Motion was made by Smiley and seconded by Beers to accept the minutes. Mayor called for a 
voice vote. Motion passed unanimously. 

The first agenda item was the Open Hearing for Citizens Present. 
No one came forward. 

The next item on the agenda: Police Department I Life Saver Awards. 
Chief Wilmeth announced 2 awards to two individuals as a result of life saving measures taken by each. 
Awards were given to Officer Tiffany L. Adams and Sergeant James Bradley. 

The next item on the agenda: Approve Consent in Lieu of a Meeting of the Sole Shareholder of the 
Illinois Water Development Company, Inc. 
Discussion: Jay Williams, City Attorney, briefed the item. A Motion to authorize the signing of the 
Consent in Lieu of Annual Meeting of the Sole Shareholder of the Illinois Water Development Company, 
Inc. was made by Smiley and seconded by Johnson. 
Roll Call: 
Bums, Johnson, Smith, Jones, Smiley, Coleman, Beers - Aye. 
7 Ayes. No Nays. Motion passed. 

The next item on the agenda: Ordinance 15-33 I 3n1 Reading I Amending Code Section 66-95 I Changing 
maximum permitted grass height from six inches to nine inches. 
Discussion: James Harris, Code Enforcement Manager, briefed the item. A Motion to place Ordinance 
15-33 I Amending Code Section 66-95 I Changing maximum pennitted grass height from six inches to 
nine inches on its third reading, suspending the rules and reading title only, was made by Smiley and 
seconded by Smith. 
Roll Call: 
Johnson, Smith, Jones, Smiley, Coleman, Beers - Aye. 
Bums - Nay. 
6 Ayes. 1 Nay. Motion passed. 



Board of Directors Meeting Minutes 
January 5, 2016 

An Ordinance entitled: 

Page 12 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 66-95 OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE TO CHANGE 
THE MAXIMUM PERMITTED HEIGHT FOR WEEDS AND GRASS FROM SIX TO NINE 

INCHES. 

Was read on its third reading. 

A Motion to adopt Ordinance 15-33 I Amending Code Section 66-95 I Changing maximum permitted 
grass height from six inches to nine inches was made by Smiley and seconded by Jones. 
Roll Call: 
Smith, Jones, Smiley, Coleman, Beers, Johnson -Aye. 
Bums - Nay. 
6 Ayes. 1 Nay. Motion passed. 

The next item on the agenda: Ordinance 16-01 I 1st Reading I Amending Chapter 6 of the Code of 
Ordinances I Alcoholic Beverages. 
Discussion: Phillip Patterson, City Administrator, briefed the item. Johnson expressed his appreciation of 
the work all the staff is doing. Bums stated he believes the City is growing in the right direction. Patterson 
stated Section 6-4H3 may need to be amended for clarity. A Motion to Place Ordinance 16-01 amending 
Chapter 6 of the City's code of ordinances regarding alcoholic beverages on its first reading, suspending 
the rules and reading title only, was made by Smiley and seconded by Smith. 
Roll Call: 
Jones, Smiley, Coleman, Beers, Bums, Johnson, Smith -Aye. 
7 Ayes. No Nays. Motion passed. 

An Ordinance entitled: 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 6, ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES, OF THE SILOAM 
SPRINGS MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADD DEFINITIONS, STATE SPECIFIC GROUNDS FOR 

SUSPENSION OR REVOATION OF PERMITS, AND FOR OTHER PURPOSES. 

Was read on its first reading. 

The next item on the agenda: Resolution 01-16 I Procedures and Organizational Matters of the Board of 
Directors. 
Discussion: Phillip Patterson, City Administrator, briefed the item. Don Cundiff, 601 W. Tahlequah, 
asked for clarification as to the public comments section. Patterson clarified. Jones asked for clarification 
for item Hon page 7. Jay Williams, City Attorney, stated he did not know off the top of his head, but can 
look it up. Patterson explained the changes to current state law. Williams gave Jones the statute number. 
A Motion to approve Resolution 01-16 I Procedures and Organizational Matters of the Board of Directors 
was made by Bums and seconded by Smiley. 
Roll Call: 
Smiley, Coleman, Beers, Bums, Johnson, Smith, Jones - Aye. 
7 Ayes. No Nays. Motion passed. 

The next item on the agenda: Resolution 02-16 I Significant Development I 1200 Block of West Valley 
Drive. 
Discussion: Ben Rhoads, Senior Planner, briefed the item. Beers explained why he would be voting on 
this matter without a conflict of interest due to his employment with John Brown University. A Motion to 



Board of Directors Meeting Minutes 
January 5, 2016 

Page J 3 

approve Resolution 02-16 I Significant Development I 1200 Block of West Valley Drive was made by 
Bums and seconded by Smiley. 
Roll Call: 
Coleman, Beers, Bums, Johnson, Smith, Jones, Smiley - Aye. 
7 Ayes. No Nays . Motion passed. 

Administrator' s Report: Phillip Patterson, City Administrator, gave an update on 2015-2016 Board of 
Director's Goals as of the end of the 4th Quarter 2015. He then stated the asphalt job in Basin 5 on 
University Street was estimated to be $29,000, but approximately $37,000 was spent creating an overage 
of $8,186.85. He then pointed out a new fonnat for code amending ordinances. Patterson reported that the 
superintendent at the Water Treatment Plant is retiring at the end of January. He stated they are proposing 
to promote the current foreman to the superintendent position. He stated they have been interviewing 
candidates to fill the foreman position, one of which is the son of the current superintendent that is 
retiring. 

Open Hearing of Directors: Mayor welcomed everyone to 2016. He then stated the City underwent a lot 
of heavy rainfall lately and would like to see a report on damages at the Kayak Park. He gave condolences 
to Lorraine Moss and Louie Thomas families. Beers gave his condolences to the Moss and Thomas 
families as well. He then thanked Officer Adams and Sergeant Bradley for their hard work. He stated he' d 
work hard on City Code without overreaching. Beers went on to give examples of economic development 
in the City to look forward to in 2016. Bums stated that the two citizens that passed had a direct impact 
on him as a child and as an adult. He expressed his appreciation of the direction we're going and the 
processing Board 's information. He then stated he is excited for 2016. He expressed his appreciation for 
recognizing the two police officers, and also wanted to recognize several off duty firefighters that 
responded to the White' s residence. He then brought up a spring across from the old Library that is now 
dry after the Basin 5 project. He asked if there is a known cause for this. Johnson stated he has been here 
one year and is proud to be here, and hopes he contributes to the City. He thanked the citizens that voted 
for him and hopes to get needs met. He stated he did read the International Property Maintenance Code 
and felt anything he had to say would be repetitive. Jones stated sales tax nwnbers are up 16% for the 
month of November. Smiley congratulated Sergeant Bradley and Officer Adams. She then thanked the 
City Administrator for the updates he provided. She gave her sympathies to the Moss and Thomas 
families. She then stated she is looking forward to working for and representing the citizens in 2016. 
Coleman stated he is overwhelmed with all the wonderful things the City accomplished in 2015 and looks 
forward to implementing most, if not all, goals in 2016. He stated he is continually in great appreciation 
for our Police and Fire Departments. He stated the Chiefs lead their staff to be as good as they are. He 
stated he is upset regarding the International Property Maintenance Code, but he does believe the City 
needs to take action. 

Coleman then made a motion to adjourn; seconded by Smiley. The Mayor called for a voice vote. All 
Ayes. Motion passed. 

Meeting adjourned. 
APPROVED: 

ATTEST: 

John Mark Turner, Mayor 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 

{seal} 



siloam.s ru -- - p _}~ 
Its a 11atuml. 

STAFF REPORT 

TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

Board of Directors; Mayor; Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
Christina Petriches, Finance Director 
1111116 
BKD, LLC Auditors 

I Recommendation: Approve the contract for audit services with BKD, LLC for up to three years. I 
Background: On December 15, 2015, the Board accepted the bid of BKD, LLC for auditing 
services for 3 years beginning with the 2015 financial year audit. Since being accepted, BKD, 
LLC has provided a contract in the form of an engagement letter for their services. In accordance 
with our purchasing policy, the Board is required to approve this contract with BKD, LLC as the 
dollar amount exceeds the purchasing authority of the City Administrator. Per their engagement 
letter, BKD, LLC will provide the audit services outlined below. 

• Issue an opinion on the financial statements as a whole 
• Issue reports on compliance with prevailing requirements for financial statements and 

grants. 
• Issue reports on internal controls over financial reporting and grants. 
• Issue a report on compliance with certain Arkansas laws. 

Staff requests authorization to accept the above referenced engagement letter and to extend such 
engagement during the approved 3-year audit period, provided that the terms remain 
substantially the same, and the cost and level of service remain acceptable to the City 
Administrator and City Finance Director. 

Fiscal Impact: The contract for 2015 auditing services totals $58,500. Costs for subsequent 
years will be $61,500 and $64,500 for the 2016 and 2017 audit, respectively. 

Attachments: None. 

- · . 

P.O. Hox 80 • Silo.1111 Spt ing,, /\ R 72761 • W\\'W.silo~msprings.com 

- - - . 



TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
SUBJECT: 

- - - - - - ------ --

silO'am s 11il --- 1 .. _J~ 
Tt~ a 111lf.1m:d 

STAFF REPORT 

Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
Don Clark, Community Services Director 
January 12, 2016 
Change Order I Library I Sidewalk on Mt. Olive 

I Recommendation: Approve Library Sidewalk Change Order in the amount of $42,944.00. 

Background: In December 2014, the City Board of Directors voted to allocate funds toward the 
building of a new Public Library located at 205 E. Jefferson Street. Due to the nature of the project 
and the size of the building, it was decided to utilize a Construction Manager at Risk for the 
construction of the building and an interior design company for the furnishings of the library. 

In respect to connectivity, staff would like to request a change order that would give more access to 
the public. This change order request will place eight hundred linear feet of five-foot wide sidewalk 
on the west side of the Siloam Springs Public Library, which is currently under construction. This 
section of sidewalk was not in the original plans, but staff feels it to be a vital addition to increase 
accessibility to the library from the downtown area. 

Fiscal Impact: Funds for the sidewalk totaling $42,944 will come out of the Library Capital 
Outlay line item 07-01-599999-075. The library furniture came in $138,870.39 under budget, so the 
addition of this sidewalk would still fall within the allotted budget. 

Attachments: Map of proposed sidewalk 

- --
P.O. Box 80 •Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • \\IWW.siloamsprings.com 

. - - - -

' 



i 
. I 

St 

'· 

.· ·., 

·. 

.---· 
\ 

\ 

\ 
\ 
\ 
\ 

I 

~--+ ULl------~f1~· T--------===----~-~-=----~--- .... ~-====~=~-~- ~--~-~-~- --- ·-·----L. , \ 

i I 

i 
i 
i 
\ 
I 
i 

\ 
I 

i 
\ 

ui \N 
1511151 

cP1c: rr 
\ ~ 
~ 

0' BL ~ 
·-·-·-·-·---.l1 

<O;< 
~ 



- ... - . ~ . --
. ·~ • l i... .,. ... . , . ~ . f 

TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

siloam s Jlil - - 1----~ 
]L's t11Jfdttmf. 

STAFF REPORT 

Mayor and Board of Directors 
Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
January 12, 2016 
Ordinance 15-31 / 1st Reading I 2015 International Property Maintenance Code. 

I Recommendation: Withdrawal of Ordinance No. 15-31. 

Background: On December I , 2015, the Board approved a motion to table the first reading of 
Ordinance No. 15-31 until the January 19, 2016 Board meeting. In addition, the Board requested that 
this issue be discussed at a workshop on January 5, 2016. Based on the workshop, it was the general 
consensus of the Board to have staff draft a property maintenance code that specifically addresses the 
Siloam Springs' issues rather than adopt a generic code. In addition to drafting a code, staff was also 
requested to allow the public, and the interested stakeholders, to review and comment on the draft before 
it is presented to the Board for consideration. 

For these reasons, staff proposes to simply withdraw Ordinance No. 15-31, subject to no objections from 
the Board. Should a Board member object, then the Board will need to process this ordinance in the 
nomrnl fashion. 

Fiscal Impact: Staff is not aware of any fiscal impact associated with this ordinance. 

Attachments: 
Ordinance No. 15-31 

- - -

P.O. Rox 80 •Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • www.si1oamsprings.com 

-- - - -



ORDINANCE NO. 15-31 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING BUILDINGS AND BUILDING 
REGULATIONS OF THE CITY; AMENDING SECTION 18 OF THE 

MUNICIPAL CODE. 

Whereas, the following amendments to the building code are hereby found to be in the best interests 
of public safety, and of the City's aesthetic appearance, and of the orderly growth and economic well-being 
of the City; Now Therefore: 

Be It Enacted, by the Board of Directors of the City of Siloam Springs, as follows: 

Section 1. 
Chapter 18 of the City Code ("Buildings and Building Regulations") is hereby 

amended as follows (added terms are underlined; deleted terms are struck through): 

Chapter 18 
Buildings and Building Regulations 

Secs. 18-223-18-~ 230. Reserved. 

DIVISION 8. PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 

Sec. 18-231 

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition, three copies of 
which have been on file in the office of the City Clerk, is hereby adopted by reference as 
the property maintenance code of the City of Siloam Springs, Arkansas, for regulating 
and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures 
within the City of Siloam Springs. 

The following sections of the International Property Maintenance Code as filed 
with the City Clerk are hereby amended or supplemented as indicated in the following 
subsections. 

a. The name "Siloam Springs, Arkansas" shall be inserted in Section 101.1. 

b. In Section 102.3, the reference to the International Building Code, 
International Existing Building Code, International Energy Conservation 
Code, International Fire Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International 
Mechanical Code, International Residential Code, International Plumbing 
Code and NFP A 70 shall be deleted and the term "Arkansas Fire Prevention 
Code - Volumes I, II and III, Arkansas Energy Code, Arkansas Fuel Gas 
Code, Arkansas Mechanical Code, Arkansas Plumbing Code" shall be 
inserted in lieu thereof. 

I 



c. In Section 102.3, the reference to the International Zoning Code shall be 
deleted and the term "Siloam Springs Municipal Code" shall be inserted in 
lieu thereof. 

d. Section 103 .4 is deleted in its entirety and is replaced with the following 
Provisions: 
The governmental immunity from liability and suit for the City and its 
employees as provided by Arkansas law shall be applicable to all activities 
of the City and its employees pursuant to this Code. 

e. Section 103 .5 is deleted. 

f. Section 109.3 shall be amended to read as follows: Closing streets. When 
necessary for public safety, the Siloam Springs Police Department shall 
temporarily close, or order the authority having jurisdiction over same to 
close, sidewalks, streets, public ways and places adjacent to unsafe 
structures and prohibit the same from being utilized. 

&. Sections 110.2, 110.3 and 110.4 are hereby deleted. There shall be added a 
section 110.2 which provides: The procedures for demolition of offending 
structures shall be those set forth in Siloam Springs Code of Ordinances 
Sections 18-241 et seq. 

h. Section 111. 7 is hereby amended to read: Any interested person shall have 
the right to apply to the appropriate court to correct errors of law in such 
decisions. 

i. In Section 201 .3, delete the terms "International Building Code, International 
Existing Building Code, International Fire Code, International Fuel Gas 
Code, International Mechanical Code, International Plumbing Code, 
International Residential Code, International Zoning Code or NFP A 70" and 
substitute, in lieu thereof, the terms " Arkansas Fire Prevention Code -
Volumes I, II and III, Arkansas Energy Code, Arkansas Fuel Gas Code, 
Arkansas Mechanical Code, Arkansas Plumbing Code and Siloam Springs 
Municipal Code". 

i In the definitional section, Section 202, delete the provided definition for 
inoperable motor vehicle and insert, in lieu thereof, the following definition of 
inoperable or unsightly motor vehicle: 

A vehicle which cannot lawfully be driven upon the public streets for 
reasons including but not limited to being unregistered, wrecked, 
dismantled, partially dismantled, abandoned, in a state of disrepair, or 
incapable of being moved under its own power is inoperable. One or more 
of the following items may cause a vehicle to be deemed to be inoperable: 

2 



.L Weed and or grass undergrowth indicates that the vehicle has not been 
recently moved 

2. One(l) or more wheels are flat or missing for more than 72 hours 

.1. Portions of the vehicle which are needed for its operation or control are 
missing 

4. Evidence exists that provisions of this code pe1iaining to zoning or to 
junk and salvage yards are being violated 

~ Registrations are not current 
6. The engine and or transmission are missing 
7. Doors, fenders, frames or axles are missing 
~ Windshields and windows are broken or missing 
9. The vehicle cannot be moved under its own power. 

k. Section 302.3 shall be amended to read as follows: All private sidewalks, 
walkways, stairs, driveways, parking spaces and similar areas shall be kept in 
a proper state of repair, and maintained free from hazardous conditions. 

1. The first sentence of Section 302.4 shall be amended to read as follows: All 
premises and exterior property shall be maintained free from weeds or plant 
growth in excess of nine (9) inches. 

m. Section 302.8 is amended to delete the phrase "inoperative or unlicensed 
motor vehicle" and substitute, in lieu thereof, the phrase "inoperable or 
unsightly motor vehicle." 

Exceptions: 

.L A vehicle of any type is permitted to undergo major overhaul, including 
body work, provided that such work is performed inside a structure or 
similarly enclosed area designed and approved for such purposes. 

2. Any motor vehicle parked or stored within a building or enclosed 
garage on private property . 

.1. Any motor vehicle held in conjunction with a business enterprise 
lawfully licensed by the City for the storage, servicing and repair of 
motor vehicles and properly operated in an appropriate business zone 
pursuant to the zoning ordinances of the City. 

4. Any motor vehicle within a carport which motor vehicle is being 
actively repaired on at least a weekly basis. The vehicle and its parts 
when not being repaired must be neatly covered with an opaque cover. 
Repairs to the inoperable motor vehicle shall be completed within 
ninety (90) days. 

5. Any motor vehicle defined as inoperable solely because it is not 
currently registered may be stored in a covered carport or completely 

3 



enclosed behind a six (6) foot opaque screening fence. No more than 
one operable non-registered vehicle will be allowed per address. 

n. Section 304.9 of the Code is amended by adding the following language to the 
end of the existing paragraph: All overhang extension coverings shall be free 
from tearing, cracked or missing pieces. Overhang extensions or frames that 
are not being utilized for their intended purpose and not properly covered shall 
be properly covered or removed from the structure. 

o. In Section 304.14, the dates of "March 1 to October l." shall be inse1ied in the 
first sentence. Additionally, there shall be added a second exception which 
reads as follows : 

Screens shall not be required where the building is equipped with a 
functioning and approved central heating, ventilating and air conditioning 
system. 

~ The following language shall be added to Section 304.18: All locks shall be 
designed and installed in such a manner so as to be operable inside of the 
dwelling unit, rooming unit, or housekeeping unit without the use of a key, 
tool, combination thereof or any other special knowledge or effort. 

~ Section 304.18. l is deleted. 

r. In Section 401.3 , the reference to the International Building Code shall be 
deleted and the term "Arkansas Fire Prevention Code" shall be inserted in lieu 
thereof. 

~ In Section 502.5, the reference to the International Plumbing Code shall be 
deleted and the term "Arkansas Plumbing Code" shall be inserted in lieu 
thereof. 

t In Section 505.1, the reference to the International Plumbing Code shall be 
deleted and the term "Arkansas Plumbing Code" shall be inserted in lieu 
thereof. 

u. In Section 602.2, the reference to the International Plumbing Code shall be 
deleted and the term "Arkansas Plumbing Code" shall be inserted in lieu 
thereof. 

v. In the first sentence of Section 602.3, the term "during the period from [date] 
to [date] 11 is deleted. 

w. In Section 602.3, the reference to the International Plumbing Code shall be 
deleted and the term "Arkansas Plumbing Code" shall be inserted in lieu 
thereof. 

4 



x. In the first sentence of Section 602.4, the phrase "during the period from 
[date] to [date]" is deleted. 

~ In Section 702.1 and 702.2, the reference to the International Fire Code shall 
be deleted and the term "Arkansas Fire Prevention Code" shall be inserted in 
lieu thereof. 

z. In Section 702.3, the reference to the International Building Code shall be 
deleted and the te1m "Arkansas Fire Prevention Code" shall be inse1ted in lieu 
thereof. 

aa. In Sections 704.1 and 704.2, the references to International Fire Code 
shall be deleted and the term "Arkansas Fire Prevention Code" shall be 

inserted in lieu thereof. 

bb. In Chapter 8, the list of referenced standard codes is deleted and the 
following list of codes is substituted in lieu thereof: 

National Electrical Code and Siloam Springs Electrical Code 
Arkansas Fire Prevention Code Volumes I, II and III Arkansas Mechanical 

Code 
Arkansas Plumbing Code 
Arkansas Fuel Gas Code 
Arkansas Energy Code Siloam Springs Municipal Code 

Section 3: All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby 
repealed. 

Section 4: If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance 
is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of 
the remaining portions of this Ordinance. The Board of Directors hereby determines and 
declares that it would have passed this Ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or 
phrase hereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more of the sections, subsections, 
sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional. 

Secs. 18-232-18-240. Reserved. 

Ordained and Enacted this ___ day of ____________ , 201 __ _ 

APPROVED: 
ATTEST: 

John Mark Turner, Mayor 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 
5 



TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

siloam. s ru --- p ___ JgS 
It's a 11tlflnnl. 

STAFF REPORT 

Mayor and Board of Directors 
Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
January 12, 2016 
Ordinance 15-32 / 2nd Reading I Amending Municipal Code Section 94-127 I Unlicensed and 
Inoperable Vehicles. 

Recommendation: Withdrawal of Ordinance No. 15-32 

Background: On December 15, 2015, the Board approved a motion to table the second reading of 
Ordinance No. 15-32 until the January 19, 2016 Board meeting. This ordinance was originally 
accompanied by Ordinance No. 15-31 adopting the International Property Maintenance Code, which 
was table to January 19, 2016 before its first reading. A Board workshop was held on January 5, 2016 
to review and discuss the adoption of the IPMC. The consensus of the Board was to have staff draft a 
property maintenance code that specifically addresses the Siloam Springs' issues rather than adopt a 
generic code. It is expected that any such draft will include a definition for inoperable vehicles, which 
was the purpose of Ordinance No. 15-32. 

For these reasons, staff proposes to simply withdraw Ordinance No. 15-32, subject to no objections from 
the Board. Should a Board member object, then the Board will need to process this ordinance in the 
normal fashion. 

Fiscal Impact: Staff is not aware of any fiscal impact associated with this ordinance. 

Attachments: 
Ordinance No. 15-32 

- - - --

P.O . Rox 80 • Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • www.siloamsprings.com 

- - - -



ORDINANCE NO. 15 -32 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 94-127 OF THE 
MUNICIPAL CODE WITH RESPECT TO UNLICENSED AND 
INOPERABLE VEHICLES IN PUBLIC VIEW. 

WHEREAS, in order to align provisions of the Siloam Springs City Code dealing with unlicensed 

and inoperable vehicles in public view with the International Property Maintenance Code; and 

WHEREAS, to better define what an inoperable vehicle is and how it can be kept; Now 

Therefore: 

BE IT ENACTED, by the Board of Directors of the City of Siloam Springs, as fo11ows: 

SECTION I. Amendment. 

Section 94-127 of the City Code (Unlicensed and inoperable vehicles in public view) is 

hereby amended as follows (added tern1s are underlined, deleted terms are struck through.): 

Sec. 94-127. - Unlicensed and inoperative vehicle in public view. 

ifil It is unlawful to have any unlicensed or inoperative motor vehicle exposed to public 
view on any private premises for a period of more than 15 days. This section shall not apply to 
any vehicle enclosed within a building on private property or to any vehicle held in connection 
with a business enterprise, la'Nfully licensed by the city and properly operated in the appropriate 
business zone, pursuant to the zoning laws of the city or to any motor vehicle in operable 
condition specifically adopted or designed for operation on drag strips or racev«ays. 

Exceptions: 

( 1.) A vehicle of any type is pennitted to undergo major overhaul, including body work, provided that 
such work is performed inside a structure or similarly enclosed area designed and approved for 
such purposes. 

(2.) Any motor vehicle parked or stored within a building or enclosed garage on private property. 

(3.) Any motor vehicle held in conjunction with a business enterprise lawfully licensed by the City for 
the storage, servicing and repair of motor vehicles and properly operated in an appropriate 
business zone pursuant to the zoning ordinances of the City. 

( 4.) Any motor vehicle within a carport which motor vehicle is being actively repaired on at least a 
weekly basis. The vehicle and its parts when not being repaired must be neatly covered with an 
opaque cover. Repairs to the inoperable motor vehicle shall be completed within ninety (90) days. 

(5.) Any motor vehicle defined as inoperable solely because it is not currently registered may be 
stored in a covered carport or completely enclosed behind a six (6) foot opaque screening fence. 
No more than one operable non-registered vehicle will be allowed per address. 



(6.) Any motor vehicle in operable condition specifically adopted or designed for operation on drag 

strips or raceways. 

(b) Definition of Inoperable Vehicle: 

A vehicle which cannot lawfully be driven upon the public streets for reasons including but not limited to 

being unregistered, wrecked, dismantled, partially dismantled, abandoned, in a state of disrepair, or 

incapable of being moved under its own power is inoperable. One or more of the following items may 

cause a vehicle to be deemed to be inoperable: 

( 1.) Weed and or grass undergrowth indicates that the vehicle has not been recently moved 

(2.) One (1) or more wheels are flat or missing for more than 72 hours 

(3.) Portions of the vehicle which are needed for its operation or control are missing 

( 4.) Evidence exists that provisions of this code pertaining to zoning or to junk and salvage yards are 

being violated 

(5 .) Registrations are not current 

(6.) The engine and or transmission are missing 

(7 .) Doors, fenders, frames or axles are missing 

(8.) Windshields and windows are broken or missing 

(9.) The vehicle cannot be moved under its own power. 

SECTION II. Repealer and severability. 

Prior Ordinances in conflict with the provisions enacted herein are repealed to the extent of 
the conflict as of the effective date of this Ordinance. If any provision of a section of this 
Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstance is held invalid, the 

invalidity does not affect the other provisions or applications of the section or related 
sections which can be given effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this 
end the provisions are severable. 

ORDAINED AND ENACTED this __ day of ___________ , 201 

APPROVED: 

ATTEST: 
John Mark Turner, Mayor 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 

(SEAL) 



TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

- .. - . .. - -

siloam s (l • QS - - {!.:!Pg. 
li's a 1111111111/. 

STAFF REPORT 

Mayor and Board of Directors 
Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
December 30, 2015 
Ordinance 16-01 I First Reading I Amending Chapter 6 of the Code of Ordinances I 
Alcoholic Beverages 

Recommendation: Approval of Ordinance 16-01 amending Chapter 6 of the City's code of ordinances 
regarding alcoholic beverages. 

Background: In 2013, the City adopted Ordinance No. 13-01, which established the most cun-ent code 
on alcoholic beverages. As with any newly written rules and regulations, once implementation occurs it 
sometimes becomes apparent that amendments are needed. So it is with the City's alcoholic beverage 
code. Due to a number of reasons, staff began reviewing and researching various amendments to 
Chapter 6 beginning in early 2015. The proposed changes are a result of this effort. 

Attached, please find a copy of the proposed changes (Exhibit A). This attachment shows the redacted 
text (deleted teJct vs. added text). The attached ordinance only shows the text of how the Code will read, 
subject to the adoption of the ordinance. The following is a short summary of the proposed 
amendments: 

1. Sec. 6-2 Definitions. The terms Disturbance and Premises have been added. 
2. Sec. 6-4 Applications for Permits. A requirement to have all members of a co-partnership identified. 

An exemption to the 200' restriction from a church or school in the Historic Downtown Overlay 
District. A list of individuals who the City will not issue a liquor permit to. A requirement for local 
criminal background checks. A requirement for what information a liquor permit must contain. 

3. Sec. 6-6 Prohibited Activities/Warning Notice. Provisions added regarding disturbances. 
4. Sec. 6-11 Beer and Wine Sales, Location. This section is proposed for deletion since the 

requirement is previously stated in section 6-4(g). 
5. Sec. 6-17 Operating without a City Pennit. Revisions clarify that providing alcoholic beverages for 

consumption on- or off-premise without a city pennit is a violation, except when in a private 
residence to family or guests. 

6. Sec. 6-19 - Revocation. Revise title to include term "suspension". Clarify procedures for hearing 
before city administrator related to a suspension or revocation of a permit. 

7. Sec. 6-20 - Statement of Causes of Suspension or Revocation of City Controlled Beverage Permit. 
New section added to require pennittees to be notified of potential causes of suspension or 
revocation of permit, along with process for notification of suspension or revocation. 

- - - -

P.O. Rox 80 •Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • www.siloamsprings.com 

- . - - -



8. Sec. 6-21 Acts Resulting in Revocation or Suspension of City Controlled Beverage License. New 
section added to identify acts that may result in suspension or revocation of pennit for up to 30, 90 
or 120 days. 

9. Sec. 6-31 (j) Special Event Alcohol Pennit. Clarifies hours of permit. Allows a person or entity to 
obtain six (6) rather than two (2) permits per year. Reduces pennit fee from $50 to $25. 

Staff believes that these proposed amendments are necessary and appropriate for the continued 
implementation and enforcement of the City's liquor rules and regulations, and in the best interest of the 
City. For these reasons staff recommends approval. 

Fiscal Impact: Staff is not aware of any significant budgetary impacts associated with these code 
amendments. 

Attachments: 
Exhibit A - Redacted copy of Code Chapter 6 
Ordinance 16-01 



EXHIBIT A 

Chapter 6 - ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES 

ARTICLE I. - GENERAL PROVISIONS 

Sec. 6-1. - Applicability. 
(a) It is hereby declared that the business of manufacturing, transporting, storing, handling, 

receiving, distributing, selling, serving, or dispensing, either at wholesale or retail, any 
controlled beverage, except wine, within the City of Siloam Springs, is a privilege, and for 
the exercise of such privilege there are hereby imposed the regulations, requirements, 
restrictions, fees, and taxes as set forth in this chapter. 

(b) These general provisions shall apply to all permittees in addition to any specific provisions 
under individual headings for each type of permit. 

( c) Nothing in this chapter shall be read as authorizing distribution, possession or consumption 
of any controlled beverage at or within the parks, athletic fields or other public facilities of 
the City of Siloam Springs. 

Sec. 6-2. - Definitions. 
For the purposes of this chapter, the following definitions shall apply unless the context 

clearly indicates or requires a different meaning. Words and phrases not specifically defined in 
this chapter shall have the meanings assigned by A.C.A. tit. 3 and/or the Arkansas Alcoholic 
Beverage Control Division Regulations. 

Alcoholic beverages means all intoxicating liquors of any sort, other than beer and wine. 

Beer means any fermented liquor made from malt or any similar substance therefor and having an 
alcohol content not in excess of five percent or less than one-half of one percent by weight. 

City means the City of Siloam Springs, Arkansas. 

Controlled beverages means all beverages of any kind subject to regulation under any alcoholic 
beverage control law of the State of Arkansas and this chapter. 

Disturbance means a breakdown of peaceful and law abiding behavior to include, but not be 
limited to, a fight, brawl or riot, or the commission of a ciiminal act. 

Hotel means every building or other structure commonly referred to as a hotel, motel, motor lodge, 
or by similar name, which is kept, used, maintained, advertised, and held out to the public to be a 
place where food is actually served and consumed and sleeping accommodations are offered for 
adequate pay to travelers or guests, whether transient, permanent, or residential, in which 50 
percent or more rooms are used for the sleeping accommodations of such guests and having one 
or more public dining rooms with adequate and sanitary kitchen facilities, and a seating capacity 
for at least 50 persons, where meals are regularly served to such guests, such sleeping 
accommodations and dining room being conducted in the same building or in separate buildings 
or structures used in connection therewith that are on the same premises and are a part of the hotel 
operation. 

Large attendance facility means a facility housing convention center activity, or touiism activity, 
or trade show and product display and related meeting activity, or any similar large meeting or 

Page 1 of 18 



attendance activity, and, either itself or through one or more independent contractors, complies 
with all of the following: 

(1) Actually serves full and complete meals and food on the premises; 
(2) Has one or more places for food service on premises with a seating capacity for not 

less than 500 people; 
(3) Employs a sufficient number and kind of employees to serve meals and food on the 

premises capable of handling at least 500 people; and 
( 4) Serves controlled beverages on premises at one or more places only on days that 

meals and food are served at one or more places on premises. 

Light wine means the fermented juices of grapes, berries, or fruits and any other mixture containing 
the fermented juice of grapes, berries, or fruits, having an alcoholic content between one-half of 
one percent and five percent alcohol by weight. 

Malt beverage products means any liquor brewed from the fermented juices of grain having an 
alcoholic content of not less than five percent nor more than 21 percent by weight. 

Malt liquor means liquor brewed from the fermented juices of grain. 

Microbrewery-restaurant means any establishment in which beer, containing not in excess of five 
percent of alcohol by weight, and/or malt beverage products, containing not in excess of 21 percent 
of alcohol by weight, are both brewed and sold at retail in a restaurant setting under the same 
ownership and in the same building or attached buildings. 

On-premises consumption means the sale of alcoholic beverages by the drink or in broken or 
unsealed containers for consumption on the premises where sold. 

Permit means any authorization issued by the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division of the State of 
Arkansas and/or by the city pursuant to any Arkansas Alcoholic Beverage Control Division 
regulation and/or this chapter of the Code of Siloam Springs whether described as a permit, license 
or otherwise. 

Permittee means the person to whom a permit has been issued. 

Person means any natural person, partnership, association, corporation, syndicate, or company. 

Premises means a defined location, structure or building, together with its land and outbuildings, 
occupied by a business and utilized in the pursuit of its interest, but excluding those areas used 
solely as a private residence. Provided that nothing in this code shall authorize sale, dispensing or 
consumption of alcoholic beverages on premises more broadly defined than authorized or licensed 
by the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division. 

Private club means a nonprofit corporation organized and existing under the laws of this state, no 
part of the net revenues of which shall inure directly or indirectly to the benefit of any of its 
members or any other individual, except for the payment of bona fide expenses of the club's 
operations, conducted for some common recreational, social, patriotic, political, national, 
benevolent, athletic, or other nonprofit object or purpose other than the consumption of alcoholic 
beverages. The nonprofit corporation shall have been in existence for a period of not less than one 
year before application for a permit. At the time of application for the permit, the nonprofit 
corporation must have not less than I 00 members regularly paying annual dues of not less than 
$5.00 per member, and, at the time of application, must own or lease, or be the holder of a buy­
sell agreement or offer and acceptance, or have an option to lease a building, property, or space 

Page 2of18 



therein for the reasonable comfort and accommodation of its members and their families and 
guests, and restrict the use of club facilities to such persons. 

Restaurant means any public place or private place kept, used, maintained, advertised and held out 
to the public or to a private or restricted membership as a place where complete meals are actually 
and regularly served, such place being provided with adequate and sanitary kitchen and dining 
equipment and a seating capacity of at least 50 people and having employed therein a sufficient 
number and kind of employees to prepare, cook and serve suitable food for its guests or members. 
At least one meal per day shall be served at least five days a week, with the exception of holidays, 
vacations and periods of redecorating. Further, on the day that alcoholic beverages are served to 
customers of the outlet, the outlet must also prepare and serve at least one complete meal for 
consumption on the premises. 

Retailer means any person who holds a permit under any alcoholic beverage control law of the 
State of Arkansas to sell at retail controlled beverages to consumers only. 

Spirituous means liquor distilled from the fermented juices of grains, fruits, or vegetables 
containing more than 21 percent alcohol by weight, or any other liquids containing more than 21 
percent alcohol by weight. 

State means the State of Arkansas. 

Vinous means the fermented juices of fruits containing more than five percent and not more than 
21 percent alcohol by weight. 

Wholesaler and distributor means any person who holds a permit under any alcoholic beverage 
control law of the State of Arkansas to purchase controlled beverages from a manufacturer or 
importer and to sell such controlled beverages to retailers only. 

Sec. 6-3. - Permits required. 
(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to engage in the business of manufacturing, transporting, 

storing, handling, receiving, distributing, selling, or dispensing, either at wholesale or 
retail, any controlled beverage, except wine, within the city without a permit issued by the 
city, or with an expired permit. 

(b) The provisions of this chapter exempting wine mean that said regulations shall not apply 
to the manufacture, sale, and distribution of wines or vinous liquors manufactured, sold, 
and distributed by residents of Arkansas. In such instances, the applicable laws and 
regulations of the State of Arkansas shall apply, and same shall be enforceable as if 
incorporated herein. 

Sec. 6-4. - Application for permits. 
(a) Application for a permit required by this chapter shall be in writing on a form prescribed 

by the city and shall be accompanied by the required fee and a copy of the applicant's state 
permit. No city permit will be issued until applicant has received a state permit. 

(b) It shall be unlawful for any person to make any false statement or representation in any 
application required by this chapter or to give any false answer to any question contained 
therein. 

(c) An application shall identify all members having ownership of a copartnership seeking a 
permit under this section. 

Page 3of18 



( eg) Permits required by this chapter shall be issued in such a manner that they will run for such 
length of time as the state permit. Annual permit renewal fees shall be due and payable 
prior to the initial opening of the business, and thereafter on September 15 of each year for 
the succeeding year. Late fees shall be imposed at the same rates and in the same manner 
as for business privilege licenses, as provided at section 22-33 of this Code. 

(a~ The city will not issue or renew any permits pursuant to this chapter until all outstanding 
hotel, motel, and restaurant taxes and/or supplemental beverage taxes, if applicable, are 
paid. 

( ef) No new permit shall be granted to any person to engage in the sale of liquor at retail, for 
consumption off the premises, for any business situated within 1,000 feet of any church or 
school. The distance shall be measured from the nearest point of the church or school 
building to the nearest point of the building to be permitted. 

(fg) No ether-new permits shall be granted to any person to engage in the business of 
manufacturing, transporting, storing, handling, receiving, distributing, selling, or 
dispensing, either at wholesale or retail, any controlled beverage, for any business situated 
within 200 feet of any church or school building. The distance shall be measured from the 
nearest point of the church or school building to the nearest point of the building to be 
permitted. The distance requirement shall not apply to businesses located in the H-lDT 
(Historic Downtown) Overlay District. 

(h) No pennit shall be issued to: 
(1) A person who has been convicted of, or plead guilty or nolo contendere to, a felony; 
(2) A person under the age of twenty-one (21) years; 
(3) A person who is not a citizen or resident alien of the United States; 
( 4) A copartnership, unless all members of such copartnership are citizens or resident 

aliens of the United States; 
(5) A person who shall have had his or her permit issued under this Code revoked for 

cause or who has been convicted of a violation of this Code until the expiration of 
two (2) years from the date of such revocation or conviction; or 

(6) A corporation or copartnership, if any of its officers or members have been 
convicted of a violation of this Code, have had a permit issued under this Code 
revoked for cause until two (2) years from the date of the conviction or revocation, 
or who have been convicted of, or plead guilty or nolo contendere to a felony. 

(7) Any person or entity not in possession of a valid City business license. 

(gi) All permits issued by the city pursuant to this chapter shall be prominently displayed on 
the permitted premises by the permittee in the same manner as required by the state for 
state permits. 

(j) In order to dete1mine an applicant's suitability for a permit, the applicant, or in the case of 
a copartnership, its members shall submit to a local c1iminal background check through the 
city's police department. The applicant(s) shall sign a release that allows the police 
department to divulge the results of all criminal background checks to the city administrator 
or his/her designee. 

(hk) When any state permit is revoked by the state or required to be returned to the state for any 
reason, the city permit shall be returned to the city. The city will restore the permit upon 
proof that the state permit has been restored to the applicant, provided that no reclaimed 
permit will be restored to an applicant until all outstanding hotel, motel, and restaurant 
taxes and/or supplemental beverages taxes, if applicable, are paid. 

Page 4of18 



(il) All fees, taxes, and penalties received by the city pursuant to this chapter shall be deposited 
to the credit of general fund revenues. 

(jm) Permits shall not be transferable or assignable except as provided by A.C.A. § 3-4-103A 
(Fiduciaries- Continuation of permitted business). 

(n) Permits issued by the city shall contain, in addition to any further information or material 
to be prescribed by the rules and regulations of the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division, 
the following: 
(1) The name of the person to whom the permit is issued; 
(2) The type of permit; 
(3) A description by street and number, or otherwise, of the permitted premises; 
(4) A statement in substance that the permit shall not be deemed a property or vested 

right and that it may be revoked at any time pursuant to law; 
(5) The name and address of the owner of the premises. Upon a change in the 

ownership, the permittee or the new owner may file notice to that effect in writing 
with the city on forms to be provided by the city for that purpose. 

Sec. 6-5. - Right of city to inspect records. 
The city shall have the right to inspect and examine the records of any permittee subject to 

any tax or permit fee based on gross sales or receipts. 

Sec. 6-6. - Prohibited activities/warning notice. 
(a) Any person to which a controlled beverage permit has been issued shall comply with all 

laws and regulations of the State of Arkansas, the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division of 
the State of Arkansas, and the City of Siloam Springs regarding the control and regulation 
of controlled beverages, including but not limited to the following: 
(1) Purchase by or for minors, sale to minors, or handling by minors prohibited. 

a. It shall be unlawful for any person under the age of 21 years to have in his 
or her possession, to purchase or attempt to purchase, or otherwise obtain 
any controlled beverages. However, this provision shall not apply to 
beverages served by members of one's family or to the use of wine in any 
religious ceremony or rite in any established church or religion. 

b. It shall be unlawful for any person to, knowingly or unknowingly, purchase 
on behalf of, furnish to, give away to, or otherwise dispose of to any person 
under the age of21 years any controlled beverages; however, this provision 
shall not apply to the serving of such to members of one's family or to the 
use of wine in any religious ceremony or rite in any established church or 
religion. 

c. It shall be unlawful for any person engaged in the business of 
manufacturing, distributing or selling, at wholesale or retail, any controlled 
beverages to sell, offer for sale, or give away, under any conditions, any 
such controlled beverages to any person under the age of 21 years. The 
burden of determining the age of any person shall be upon the seller. 

d. It shall be unlawful for any wholesaler, retailer, or transporter of controlled 
beverages to allow any employee or other person under the age of 21 years 
of age to have anything whatsoever to do with the sale, transporting or 
handling of controlled beverages. However, with the written consent of a 

Page 5of18 



parent or guardian, persons 18 years of age and older may be employed by 
licensed liquor and beer wholesalers and by licensed native wineries to 
handle controlled beverages at the place of business of the licensed 
wholesaler or wineries. 

(2) A warning notice regarding the sale to, possession or purchase by, or furnishing to 
minors of controlled beverages shall be posted in a conspicuous place in public 
view in each place of business where controlled beverages are sold, served or 
dispensed, including all drive up windows. The warning notices shall be of the size, 
have the content, and be posted in the manner as prescribed by the Arkansas 
Alcoholic Beverage Control Division. 

(b) Except where otherwise expressly authorized under the laws of the State of Arkansas, no 
establishment selling controlled beverages, including beer and small farm wine, may sell 
or otherwise distribute controlled beverages through drive-up windows. Any premises 
licensed for controlled beverage sales that maintains or operates a drive-up window for 
sales of food or other merchandise must post a notice not less than three inches by five 
inches, clearly affixed to the drive up window and clearly visible to patrons thereof, stating 
"NO ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES SOLD THROUGH THIS DRIVE UP WINDOW.'' The 
same notice must also be posted on the interior of the permitted outlet so as to be clearly 
visible to employees selling items, through the drive up window. 

( c) No person i,,vho has received a license under any ordinance of the City of Siloam Springs 
permittee for the sale or dispensing of alcoholic beverages for on-premises consumption 
including private club licenses shall suffer or permit any person to appear on the licensed 
premises in such manner or attire as to expose to view any portion of the pubic area, anus, 
vulva, or genitals or any simulation thereof, nor suffer or permit any female to appear on 
the premises in such manner or attire as to expose to view any portion of her breast below 
the top of the areola or any simulation thereof. 

( d) That no person shall bring into or consume or allow to be brought into or allow to be 
consumed intoxicants or alcoholic beverages of any kind, in any commercial establishment, 
or business, which suffers or permits any person to appear on the premises in such manner 
or attire as to expose to view any portion of the pubic area, anus, vulva, or genitals or any 
simulation thereof, or suffers or permits any female to appear on the premises in such 
manner or attire as to expose to view any portion of her breast below the top of the areola 
or any simulation thereof. 

(e) It shall be unlawful for any pern1ittee to willfully permit any disturbance or unlawful or 
disorderly act or conduct to be committed by any person or group of persons upon any 
premises permitted for the sale of controlled beverages. 

Cf) It shall be unlawful for any permittee, in any manner to encourage or participate in any 
disturbance or unlawful or disorderly act or conduct upon any premise permitted for the 
sale of controlled beverages. However, such person engaged in the sale of controlled 
beverages may use such lawful means as may be proper to protect his person or property 
from damage or injury. 

(g) Permittees, or their managers on duty, shall promptly report any disturbance on the 
premises. 

(h) It shall be unlawful for any permittee to not post and keep at all times visible to the public, 
in a conspicuous place on the premises, a sign to be furnished by the city , which sign shall 
be in the following fom1: "WARNING - THE CITY OF SILOAM SPRINGS POLICE 

Page 6of18 



DEPARTMENT MUST BE NOTIFIED OF ALL DISTURBANCES IN THIS 
ESTABLISHMENT". 

( ei) If any person engaged in the sale of controlled be>.·erages in the citypermittee shall conduct 
his place of business in a manner as to constitute a nuisance, the city administrator, subject 
to appeal to the board of directors, shall revoke the license of such person to sell controlled 
beverages in the city. 

(fj.) Any person violating any provision of this ordinance shall be subject to the general 
penalties as set out in section 1-7 of the Code of Siloam Springs. 

Sec. 6-7. - Liquids exempt. 
The articles enumerated in this section shall not, after having been manufactured and 

prepared for the market, be subject to the provisions of this chapter: 
(l-,!!) Denatured alcohol or denatured rum produced and used as provided by laws and 

regulations now or hereinafter in force. 
(2.Q) Medical preparations manufactured in accordance with formulae prescribed by the 

United States Pharmacopoeia, national formulary or the American Institute of Homeopathy 
that are unfit for use for beverage purposes. 

(~~) Patented, patent and proprietary medicines that are unfit for use for beverage 
purposes. 

( 4.Q) Toilet, medical and antiseptic preparations and solutions that are unfit for use for 
beverage purposes. 

(~S'.) Flavoring extracts and syrups that are unfit for use as a beverage or for intoxicating 
beverage purposes. 

(ef)Vinegar and preserved sweet cider. 
(+g) Alcohol medicated according to such formulae as will render it unfit for beverage 

purposes and which is to be sold for legitimate external use. 
(&h) Alcohol for mechanical and scientific purposes if unfit for a beverage. 
(9-i)The provisions of this chapter shall not apply to pure, ethyl or denatured alcohol intended 

for use and/or used for scientific, chemical, mechanical, industrial, medicinal and/or 
culinary purposes, or for use in the manufacture of patented, patent, proprietary, medicinal, 
pharmaceutical, antiseptic, toilet, scientific, chemical, mechanical and industrial 
preparations or products unfit for beverage purposes. 

Sec. 6-8. - Drinking in public place. 
No person shall, in any public place, highway, street, or in or upon any passenger coach or 

in or upon any vehicle commonly used for the transportation of passengers, or in or about any 
depot, platform, waiting station or room, drink any intoxicating liquor, beer or wine. 

Sec. 6-9. - Public intoxication. 
No person shall be drunk or intoxicated in any public place, public building or at any public 

gathering. 

Sec. 6-10. - Sunday sale of wine, beer. 
(a) Notwithstanding any other provision of this chapter, it shall be unlawful for any person to 

sell any wine or beer for off-premises consumption on Sunday. 

Page 7of18 



(b) Any person violating this section shall be punished by a fine of not less than $50.00 nor 
more than $100.00. 

See. 6 11. Beer and wine sales, loeation. 
No person shall engage in the retail or wholesale sale, trade, or giving av1ay of beer or wine 

within 200 feet of any church or school building. 

Secs. 6-H-11-6-15. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE II. - PENALTIES/SUSPENSION/REVOCATION 

Sec. 6-16. - Furnishing to or consumption by minors, drunkards or intoxicated persons. 
(a) Any person convicted of knowingly or unknowingly selling, serving, giving, procuring or 

otherwise furnishing any controlled beverage to any person under 21 years of age, or 
habitual drunkard or intoxicated person shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall 
be fined not less than $200.00 nor more than $500.00. 

(b) Any person under the age of 21 years or habitual drunkard or intoxicated person who has 
in his or her possession, purchases or attempts to purchase, or otherwise obtain any 
controlled beverage shall, upon conviction, be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall 
be subject to a fine of not less than $10.00 nor more than $500.00. 

Sec. 6-17. - Operating without a city permit. 
(a) Beer and light wine. Any person who sells, serves, barters, exchanges, or gives away beer 

or light wine without having a valid city permit as provided by this chapter shall, upon 
conviction, be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be fined not more than $500.00. 
Each day of such operation without a valid city permit shall constitute a separate and 
distinct offense. 

(b) On-premises consumption, including private clubs. Any person who sells, serves, barters, 
exchanges, or gives away controlled beverages, except wine, for on-premises consumption 
without having a valid city permit as provided by this chapter shall, upon conviction, be 
deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be fined not more than $500.00. Each day of 
such operation without a valid city permit shall constitute a separate and distinct offense. 

(c) General. Any person, except as provided in fsubsections (a) and (b) above, who sells, 
serves, barters, exchanges, or gives away controlled beverages, except wine, for 
consumption on- or off-premise, without having a valid city permit as provided in this 
chapter shall, upon conviction, be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be fined not 
more than $500.00. Each day of such operation without a valid city permit shall constitute 
a separate and distinct offense. Provided, however, that these provisions shall not be 
construed to require a license of any lawful occupant of private premisesin their private 
residence to serve alcohol, without charge, to family or guests. 

Sec. 6-18. - General penalty. 
Except as set forth above, any person violating any provision of this chapter shall be subject 

to the general penalties as set out in section 1-7 of the Code of Siloam Springs. 

Sec. 6-19. -:: Suspension or Revocation. 

Page 8of18 



(a) The city administrator may, upon his own complaint or that of any law enforcement officer 
or agency having jurisdiction over the permitted premises, suspend, cancel or revoke any 
permit granted under this chapter if the permit granted to such permittee by the state is 
suspended, canceled or revoked respectively for any reason, or ifthe permittee is convicted 
of any violation of applicable state law, or is guilty of any of the other acts or omissions 
listed as causes under A.C.A. § 3-9-235(b ), as grounds for revoking a state permit. 

(b) The city administrator may, for any other lawful reason, suspend for a period not to exceed 
six months or revoke the license permit of any licensee permittee violating this chapter 
after due notice to the licensee permittee and an opportunity for the licensee permittee to 
be heard. 

(c) The proceedings shall be in accordance with rules and regulations established by the city 
administrator and not inconsistent with law. However, the city administrator shall not be 
bound by the legal rules of evidence in conducting hearings and in making his or her 
decisions and may take into consideration any testimony, papers, or documents which he 
or she may deem relevant to the issue. 

(e.Q) When any license permit is revoked, no new license pennit shall be issued to the same 
person, partnership or corporation within one year of such revocation. 

Sec. 6-20. - Statement of causes of suspension or revocation of city controlled beverage 
permit. 
(a) There shall be printed and furnished by the City to each permittee a statement of the causes 

for which controlled beverage permits may be suspended or revoked. 
(b) The statement shall be prepared by the city administrator or their designee and delivered 

to the permittee as soon as may be practicable thereafter. 
( c) Any amendments therein shall also be sent by the city administrator or their designee to all 

permittees as soon as may be practicable after the amendment. 
(d) Failure to send the statement or changes therein, or failure to receive them, or any 

misstatement or error contained in the statement or amendments shall, however, not be an 
excuse or justification for any violation or remit or decrease any penalty or forfeiture 
therefor. 

(e) Within three (3) days after a permit shall have been suspended or revoked, notice thereof 
shall be given to the permittee by mailing the notice addressed to him or her at the premises 
permitted. 

(f) Notice shall also be mailed to the owner of the premises permitted. 
(g) The holder of the permit shall thereupon surrender the permit to the city administrator or 

his/her designee. 
(h) The mailing of the permit by the permittee to the city administrator or his/her designee by 

registered mail or insured parcel post shall be deemed sufficient compliance with this 
prov1s10n. 

(i) The city administrator, immediately upon notice of suspension or revocation, shall serve a 
written notice thereof upon to the police chief and the city clerk. 
(1) This notice shall identify the pennit number of the suspended pennit, and state the 

nan1e and place of residence of the holder, the location of the permitted premises, 
and the date when the permit was suspended or revoked. In the case of a 
suspension, the notice shall include the dates of the suspension. 

Page 9of18 



(2) In case the pennit is not immediately surrendered, the city administrator shall issue 
a written demand for the surrender of the permit and deliver the demand to the 
police chief. The police chief or their designee shall immediately take possession 
of the permit and return the permit to the city administrator or his/her designee. 

Sec. 6-21. Acts Resulting in Revocation or Suspension of City Controlled Beverage License: 
(a) The prohibited acts identified in section 6-6 of this chapter and reasons for suspension or 

revocation of a permit identified in section 6-19 notwithstanding, the following acts on the 
part of any permittee or their employees are violations which may result in the suspension 
of the permittee ' s city controlled beverage permit for a period up to 30 days: 
( 1) Sale of controlled beverages when the pennit is not posted; 
(2) Failure to maintain health, safety, and sanitary standards; 
(3) Consuming, or under the influence of, a controlled beverage while on duty; 
( 4) Failure to surrender a permit when the business has been voluntarily inoperative for 

over thirty (30) days; 
(5) Use of an unlabeled dispensing faucet; 
(6) Allowing prostitutes to frequent the premises; 
(7) Allowing immoral conduct on the premises; 
(8) Negligently selling to users of narcotics; 
(9) Delivery of controlled beverages by a retailer away from his or her permitted 

premises; 
( 10) Sale of controlled beverages in a container or of a size other than approved by the 

Arkansas Beverage Control Division for such use; 
( 11) Misrepresentation of a brand, or keeping beverages in an unauthorized container, 

or refilling, diluting, or failing to destroy empty bottles; 
( 12) Failure to maintain membership books or properly maintain guestbooks by a private 

club; 
(13) Allowing an unauthorized guest in a private club; 
(14) Dispensing to nonmembers or non-guests by a private club; 
( 15) Unauthorized purchasing by a private club from other than a retailer; 
(16) Failure to maintain financial records; 

(b) The prohibited acts identified in section 6-6 of this chapter and reasons for suspension or 
revocation of a permit identified in section 6-19 notwithstanding, the following acts on the 
part of any permittee or their employees are violations which may results in the suspension 
of the pennittee' s city controlled beverage permit for a period up to 90 days: 
(1) Defacing, destroying, or altering a permit; 
(2) Manufacturing, selling, offering, dispensing, or giving away, possessmg, or 

transporting controlled beverages upon which tax is not paid; 
(3) Failure to maintain proper records by a manufacturer; 
(4) Selling to any person the permittee knows or has reasonable cause to believe is 

acquiring the controlled beverages for the purpose of illegal sale or other prohibited 
disposition (bootlegging); 

(5) Accepting food stanlpS in payment for controlled beverages; 
(6) Sale of controlled beverages by vending machine. 

(c) The prohibited acts identified in section 6-6 of this chapter and reasons for suspension or 
revocation of a pennit identified in section 6-19 notwithstanding, the following acts on the 

Page 10of18 



part of any permittee or their employees are violations which may results in the suspension 
of the permittee' s city controlled beverage permit for a period up to 120 days: 
(1) Failure to furnish access to premises by any law enforcement officer or any 

authorized Alcoholic Beverage Control Division personnel or failure to cooperate 
or take reasonable action to assist any such law enforcement officers or authorized 
division personnel who are on the permitted premises in the perfonnance of their 
duties; 

(2) Failure to allow inspection of books or records; 
(3) Posting permit on unauthorized premises; 
(4) Manufacture or possession of controlled beverage with excess alcoholic content; 
(5) The permittee possessed or knew or reasonably should have known that any agent 

or employee or patron of the establishment possessed, used, sold or produced on 
the permitted premises any illegal drug or narcotic or controlled substance or that 
any agent or employee while acting on the permittee's behalf knowingly allowed 
the possession, use, sale or production on the permitted premises of any illegal drug 
or narcotic or controlled substance; 

(6) Selling or allowing the consumption of alcoholic beverages on the permitted 
premises when the pennit is suspended or on inactive status; 

(7) Selling to minors; 
(8) Unauthorized employment of a minor; 
(9) Disorderly conduct or a breach of the peace by a patron or employee on the 

permitted premises. Disorderly conduct includes without limitation a fight, brawl, 
or disturbance that results in bodily injury to a person on the permitted premises; 

(10) Selling to an intoxicated person; 
(11) Unauthorized manufacturing, selling, offering, dispensing, or giving away of 

controlled beverages; 
(12) Conducting or permitting gambling on premises, not including bingo and raffles 

allowed in A.C.A. § 23-114-101 Charitable Bingo and Raffles Enabling Act, or a 
lottery allowed in A.C.A. § 23-115-101 Arkansas Scholarship Lottery Act; 

(13) Violation oflegal closing hours; 
(14) Possession of a weapon on the permitted premises by a person without a possessory 

or proprietary interest in the permitted premises, unless otherwise authorized by 
law. 

Secs. 6-20-6-25. - Reserved. 

ARTICLE III. - TYPES OF PERMITS-FEES-SPECIFIC PROVISIONS-HOURS OF 
OPERATION 

Sec. 6-26. - Wholesale. Modified 
(a) Wholesale liquor permit. Authorizes the purchase from licensed manufacturers or 

importers of spirituous and vinous beverages or malt liquor containing more than five 
percent alcohol by weight, and the sale of such beverages to persons holding a valid liquor 
off-premises permit or a hotel, motel or restaurant on-premises consumption permit. 

Page 11of18 



( 1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 15 
of$500.00 for each and every establishment engaged in storing, transporting and/or 
selling at wholesale any spirituous or vinous (except wine) liquors within the city. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any person to sell, offer for sale, or give 
away, at wholesale, any spirituous, vinous, or malt liquors before the hours of 6:00 
a.m. and after the hour of 11:00 p.m. on weekdays, 12:00 midnight on Friday and 
Saturday, at any hour on Sunday, on Christmas Day, or during any 24-hour interval 
designated an emergency period by the mayor, board of directors, or any person 
acting in the mayor's or board of director's capacity. 

(b) Wholesale beer and light wine permit. Authorizes the purchase of beer, light wine or malt 
liquor from a licensed manufacturer or importer and the sale of such beverages to retailers 
holding a valid permit to sell beer, light wine or malt liquor for consumption on or off the 
premises. 
(1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 15 

of $125.00 for each and every wholesale dealer, broker or distributor of beer and 
light wine. (Per A.C.A. § 3-5-101, wholesalers of beer may sell malt liquor.) 

(2) Hours of operation. The authorized hours of operation shall be the same as for 
wholesale liquor dealers in [subsection] (a). 

(3) [Report of sales.] All wholesale dealers and distributors selling beer and light wine 
to retail dealers within the city shall provide to the city's accounting division on or 
before June 30 of each year a report of said distributor's total sales of beer and light 
wine for the previous calendar year to each retailer within the city. No wholesale 
beer and light wine permit will be renewed until such report has been received by 
the city. 

Secs. 6-27-6-30. - Reserved. 

Sec. 6-31. - Retail. Modified 
(a) Retail liquor off-premises permit. Authorizes the purchase of spirituous and vinous 

beverages from any person holding a valid wholesale liquor permit and the sale of such 
beverages at retail to consumers for consumption off the premises; any holder of a liquor 
off-premises permit may also purchase malt liquors containing more than five percent 
alcohol by weight from either persons holding a wholesale beer permit or a wholesale 
liquor pem1it, and sell such beverages to consumers for consumption off the premises 
described in the permit. It shall be unlawful for any person to accept retail orders for any 
spirituous, vinous, or malt liquors for delivery outside of the premises of the store operated 
by such person. 
(1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 15 

of $250.00 for each and every retail liquor dealer engaged in the business of selling 
or dispensing, at retail any vinous (except wine), spirituous, or malt liquors for off­
premises consumption. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any person to sell or offer to sell an 
controlled beverages for off-premises consumption before the hour of 7:00 a.m. or 
after the hour of 11 :00 p.m. on weekdays, after the hour of 12:00 midnight on Friday 
or Saturday and at any hour on Sunday on Christmas Day, or during any 24-hour 
period designated an emergency by the mayor or the board of directors. 

Page 12of18 



(b) Retail beer and light wine off-premises permit. Authorizes the purchase of beer, light wine, 
or malt liquor containing less than five percent alcohol by weight from wholesalers holding 
a valid permit and the sale of such controlled beverages for consumption off the premises 
described in the permit. 
(1) Permit fee. For the privilege of selling beer and light wine, at retail, for off-premises 

consumption, there is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 
15 as follows: 
a. For a retailer whose annual gross sales of beer and/or light wine do not 

exceed $1,000.00, the permit fee shall be $15.00. 
b. For a retailer whose annual gross sales of beer and/or light wine exceed 

$1,000.00, the permit fee shall be $15.00 plus one-half-cent for each dollar 
of gross sales in excess of $1,000.00. 

c. The permit fee for a new applicant with no sales history shall be $40.00. 
d. For the purpose of renewing an existing permit, annual sales shall be the 

actual gross sales for the previous calendar year. If the permittee has not 
been in operation for a full year at December 31 of the previous year, annual 
sales shall be determined by dividing the total actual sales by the number of 
months of operation and multiplying the result by 12. 

e. If a new permit was issued between March 15 and September 14, the first 
renewal rate (due on September 15 of the issue year) shall be $40.00. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any person to sell or offer to sell beer 
or light wine for off-premises consumption before the hour of7:00 a.m. or after the 
hour of 11 :00 p.m. on weekdays, after the hour of 12:00 midnight on Friday or 
Saturday, at any hour on Sunday, on Christmas Day, or during any 24-hour period 
designated an emergency by the mayor or board of directors. 

( c) Retail beer and light wine on-premises permit. Authorizes the purchase of beer, light wine, 
or malt liquor containing less than five percent alcohol by weight from a wholesaler 
holding a valid permit and the sale of such controlled beverages for consumption on or off 
the premises described in the permit. 
(1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee of the same amounts and 

computed in the same manner as the annual fees for retail beer and light wine off 
premises in [subsection] (b) above. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any person to serve, sell, offer for sale, 
or give away for consumption on-premises any beer or light wine between the hours 
of 1 :00 a.m. and 7:00 a.m. on Monday through Saturday, on Sunday except during 
the hours of I 0:00 a.m. until midnight, on Christmas Day, or during any 24-hour 
interval designated an emergency period by the mayor, board of directors, or any 
person acting in the mayor's or the board of director's capacity. 

( d) Private club permit. Authorizes the purchase of any controlled beverages from persons 
holding an off-premises retail liquor or beer permit who have been designated by the 
director of the State Alcoholic Beverage Control Board as a private club distributor, and 
authorizes the dispensing of such beverages for consumption on the premises of the private 
club to members and guests only of the private club. (Private clubs holding a retail beer 
on-premises permit may purchase beer, light wine, or malt liquor containing not more than 
five percent alcohol by weight from holders of valid wholesale beer permits). 

Page 13 of 18 



(1) Permit fee. For the privilege of operating a private club within the city, there is 
hereby levied an annual permit fee of $250.00. For any new private club permit 
issued between March 15 and September 14, the first renewal rate (due on 
September 15 of the issue year) shall be $125.00. 

(2) Supplemental beverage tax. In addition to the $250.00 per year permit fee, there is 
hereby imposed and levied a city supplemental tax of five percent upon the annual 
gross receipts which are derived by such private club from charges to the members 
and/or their guests for the following services: 
a. For the preparation and serving of mixed drinks; and 
b. For the cooling and serving of beer, light wine, and wine. 

The city's supplemental beverage tax is in addition to the state supplemental 
tax on private clubs and shall be paid to the appropriate city official, shall 
be due monthly at the same time that the state supplemental tax is due, and 
shall be accompanied by one copy of the state supplemental tax return. If 
any permittee shall fail to remit the supplemental tax within the time period 
that the state tax is due, a penalty of 12Yi percent of the tax due shall be due 
and payable in addition to the tax. 

(3) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for the owner, operator, or any employee 
of a private club to serve or permit the consumption of any controlled beverages on 
the premises of said private club between the hours of 2:00 a.m. and 10:00 a.m. on 
any day, or during any 24-hour interval designated an emergency period by the 
mayor, board of directors, or any person acting in the mayor's or the board of 
director's capacity. 

( e) On-premises consumption- Hotel, motel or restaurant permit. Authorizes the purchase of 
any controlled beverages from persons holding a valid wholesale permit and the sale of 
such beverages for consumption on the premises of the restaurant described in the permit 
or in-room hospitality units of the hotel or motel described in the permit. (Persons holding 
an on-premises consumption hotel, motel, or restaurant permit are not required to have a 
retail beer permit). 
(I) Permit fee. For the privilege of selling controlled beverages for on-premises 

consumption by hotels, motels, or restaurants, in accordance with A.C.A. § 3-9-201 
et seq., there is hereby levied annual permit fees in the following applicable 
amounts: 
a. Hotel or motel having fewer than 100 rooms, $250.00. 
b. Hotel or motel having 100 or more rooms, $500.00. 
c. Restaurants having a seating capacity ofless than 100 persons, $250.00 
d. Restaurants having a seating capacity of 100 or more persons, $500.00. 
e. Any new permit issued for on-premises consumption hotel, motel, or 

restaurant operations between March 15 and September 14, shall be at one­
half the rates shown above. 

(2) Supplemental beverage tax. In addition to the annual permit fees for the sale of 
controlled beverages for on-premises consumption by hotels, motels, or restaurants, 
there is hereby levied a city supplemental beverage tax of five percent upon the 
annual gross proceeds or gross receipts from the sale of alcoholic beverages 
pursuant to this subsection. Wine, beer, light wine, and malt liquors containing less 

Page 14of18 



than five percent alcohol by weight, shall not be subject to the supplemental 
beverage tax. 
The city's supplemental beverage tax is in addition to the state supplemental tax and 
shall be paid to the appropriate city official, shall be due monthly at the same time 
that the state supplemental tax is due, and payment shall be accompanied by one 
copy of the state supplemental tax return. If any permittee shall fail to remit the 
supplemental tax within the time period that the state tax is due, a penalty of 1211 
percent of the tax due shall be due and payable in addition to the tax. 

(3) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any person holding an on-premise 
consumption hotel, motel or restaurant permit to sell, offer for sale, serve give 
away, or permit consumption of any controlled beverages between the hours of 2 :00 
a.m. and 10:00 a.m. on Monday through Saturday, on Sunday except between the 
hours of 10:00 a.m. until midnight (except when a Sunday falls on December 31 of 
any year, in which case until 2:00 a.m. the following Monday), on Christmas Day, 
or during any 24-hour interval designated an emergency period by the mayor, board 
of directors, or any person acting in the mayor's or the board of director's capacity. 

(f) Large attendance facility permit. Authorizes the sale of all types of controlled beverages 
by a facility which houses a convention center activity, or tourism activity where such 
establishment has a seating capacity of not less than 500 people and which serves 
controlled beverages only on the premises on days that meals and food are served at one or 
more places on the premises. 
(1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee of $500.00 for each and 

every large attendance facility within the city. For any new permit issued between 
March 15 and September 14, the permit fee shall be one-half of the above amount. 

(2) Supplemental beverage tax. Large attendance facilities shall be subject to the same 
supplemental beverage taxes, due dates, and penalties as on-premises consumption 
hotel, motel, or restaurant permittees in [subsection] ( e) . 

(3) Hours of operation. The hours of operation for large attendance facility permittees 
shall be the same as those allowed for on-premises consumption hotel, motel, or 
restaurant permittees in [subsection] (e). 

(g) Off-premises caterer permit. Authorizes the purchase of alcoholic beverages from a retailer 
to transport to a private function which is being catered by the permit holder and to serve 
alcoholic beverages to attendees of the private function in conjunction with catered food. 
(1) Permit fee. A permit fee of $250.00 is levied annually, renewable on September 15. 

For any new permit issued between March 15 and September 14, the permit fee 
shall be half of the above amount. 

(2) Hours of operation. The hours of operation for an off-premises catering permittee 
shall be the same as those allowed for on-premises consumption hotel, motel, or 
restaurant permittees in [subsection] (e). 

(h) Restaurant beer and wine permit. Authorizes a restaurant which has a valid state restaurant 
beer and wine permit to obtain a City of Siloam Springs Restaurant Beer and Wine Permit 
for the retail sale of beer and wine pursuant to A.C.A. § 3-9-301 and§ 3-4-1001 et seq. 
(1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 

15, of the same amounts and computed in the same manner as the annual fees for 
retail beer and light wine off-premises and on-premises permits in subsections (b) 
and (c) of this section. 

Page 15 of1 8 



(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any restaurant to sell beer or wine 
through this permit beyond the hours established for the retail beer and light wine 
on-premises permit of subsection ( c ). 

(i) Satellite catering permit to serve large meeting or attendance facility. Only caterers with 
on-premises consumption - hotel, motel and restaurant permits authorized by subsection 
(e) may cater alcoholic beverages in large meeting and attendance facilities as defined in 
A.C.A. § 3-9-202(8). 
( 1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 15 

for a satellite catering permit of $250.00. For any new permit issued between March 
15 and September 14, the permit fee shall be half of the above amount. 

(2) Supplemental beverage tax. Satellite catering activities will be subject to the same 
supplemental beverage taxes, due dates, and penalties as on-premises consumption 
hotel, motel, or restaurant permittees in subsection (e). 

(3) Hours of operation. The hours of operation for any satellite catering permittee shall 
be the same as those allowed for on-premises consumption hotel, motel, or 
restaurant permittee in subsection (e). 

(j) Special event alcohol permit. Authorizes any person, 21 years of age or older and not 
otherwise prohibited by the laws of the State of Arkansas or the United States, to purchase 
a permit authorizing the dispensing of controlled beverages for consumption on private 
premises that are not otherwise licensed for such distribution by the City of Siloam Springs. 
Said permit shall be subject to the following conditions: 

a. Application for said permit must be made no less than 15 days in advance. 
b. Said permit shall be good for the hours of 10:00 a.m. to 12:00 'f7;"ffr;midnight 

during one 24-hour period designated by the applicant. 
c. Said permit shall not authorize the dispensing of any controlled beverages 

on city property, or any other location prohibited by law, including within 
applicable distances from church or school buildings. 

d. No person or entity may obtain more than twe--six (6) special event alcohol 
permits during any given calendar year. 

e. The city reserves the right to deny any request for a special event alcohol 
permit if, in the opinion of the city administrator, fire chief, chief of police 
or any public health official, such permit would be detrimental to public 
health, safety or welfare. 

(1) Permit fee. The special event alcohol permit fee shall be $.W25.00, payable at the 
time of application. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for the holder of any special event alcohol 
permit, or their agent or employee, to serve or permit the consumption of any 
controlled beverages on the permitted premises outside of the hours set forth in the 
permit, or during any 24-hour interval designated an emergency period by the 
mayor, board of directors, or any person acting in the mayor's or the board of 
director's capacity. 

(k) Microbrewery permit. Aauthorizes a!! establishment, with appropriate state licenses, to 
operate a microbrewery which shall manufacture one or more varieties of beer or malt 
beverage in an aggregate quantity not to exceed 5,000 barrels per year and to store any 
such beer or malt beverage and any other beer or malt beverage which the microbrewery­
restaurant licensee may purchase from wholesalers licensed by this state on the 

Page 16of18 



microbrewery-restaurant licensed premises. The establishment holding said permit may 
also: 

a. Operate a restaurant (if otherwise properly zoned and licensed by the city) 
which shall be the sales outlet for beer or malt beverage manufactured by 
the microbrewery and which shall sell the beer or malt beverage and any 
other beer or malt beverage which the microbrewery-restaurant licensee 
may purchase from wholesalers licensed by this state for consumption on 
the licensed premises; 

b. Sell on the premises beer or malt beverages manufactured by the 
microbrewery in brewery-sealed packages at retail directly to the consumer 
for off-premises consumption; 

c. Provide products it manufactures to charitable or nonprofit organizations or 
sell for resale products it manufactures to charitable or nonprofit 
organizations holding valid special event alcohol permits as provided for by 
the alcoholic beverage control board, and City of Siloam Springs, except 
that the microbrewery-restaurant licensee may not sell to nonprofit 
organizations holding private club licenses. The sale of those products shall 
be limited to the duration of the particular special event; and 

d. Sell beer or malt beverages manufactured by the microbrewery-restaurant 
to a nonprofit corporation leasing space in the microbrewery-restaurant or 
in an adjoining building. 

(1) Permit fee. There is hereby levied an annual permit fee renewable on September 
15, of the same amounts and computed in the same manner as the annual fees for 
retail beer and light wine off-premises and on-premises permits in subsections (b) 
and (c) of this section. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for any restaurant to sell beer or wine 
through this permit beyond the hours established for the retail beer and light wine 
on-premises permit of subsection ( c ). 

Sec. 6-36. - Manufacturing. 
(a) Liquor manufacturing permit. Authorizes the manufacture or distilling of spirituous or 

vinous liquors, and the sale to persons holding valid permits to wholesale or import such 
liquors. 
(1) Permit fee. 

a. For the manufacturing and sale of spirituous liquors, the annual permit fee 
renewable on September 15 shall be $500.00 for each and every 
manufacturing plant. 

b. For the manufacturing and sale of vinous (except wine) liquors, the annual 
permit fee renewable on September 15 shall be $250.00 for each and every 
manufacturing plant. 

(b) Beer manufacturing permit. Authorizes the manufacture of beer containing not in excess 
of five percent alcohol by weight, and the sale of such beer to persons holding a valid 
permit to wholesale or import such beer. 
(1) Permit fee. For the manufacture and sale of beer, the annual permit fee renewable 

on September 15 shall be $250.00 for each and every manufacturing plant. 
(2) However, no city manufacturing permit shall be required for home-brewed beer: 

Page 17of18 



a. Upon the manufacturer's own premises; 
b. For consumption by the manufacturer and his or her family and guests, but 

not for sale; and 
c. In quantities per calendar year not to exceed: 

1. Two hundred gallons if there are two or more adults in the 
household; or 

2. One hundred gallons if there is only one adult in the household. 
(3) Any manufacturer of home-brewed beer must have attained 21 years of age. 
(4) "Home-brewed" means beer made from malted barley, wheat, or cereal grains, or 

any substitute therefor, and having an alcoholic content not in excess of five percent 
by weight, brewed for consumption by the manufacturer and his or her family and 
guests, but not for sale. 

( c) Rectifying permit. Authorizes the rectifying, purifying, mixing, blending, or flavoring of 
spirituous liquors or the bottling, warehousing, or other handling or distribution of rectified 
distilled spirits. Rectifiers may sell, deliver, or transport only to wholesalers holding a valid 
permit to wholesale, to other rectifiers, or for the purpose of export out of state. 
(1) Permit fee. For the privilege ofrectifying, blending, or flavoring spirituous liquors, 

there is hereby assessed an annual permit fee, renewable on September 15, of 
$750.00 for each and every rectifying, blending, or flavoring plant. 

Secs. 6-37-6-40. - Reserved. 

Page 18of18 



ORDINANCE NO. 16 - 01 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 6, ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES, OF THE 
SILOAM SPRINGS MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADD DEFINITIONS, STATE SPECIFIC 

GROUNDS FOR SUSPENSION OR REVOCATION OF PERMITS, AND FOR OTHER 
PURPOSES. 

WHEREAS, experience has shown the need for certain clarifications and technical corrections to the 
Siloam Springs Alcoholic Beverage Code; and 

WHEREAS, the following amendments will provide greater clarity to alcohol permittees, city staff 
and the general public as to allowed activities, as well as penalties and remedies for violations; and 

WHEREAS, said changes are in the best interest of the health, safety and general welfare of the 
citizens of Siloam Springs; 

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ENACTED, by the Board of Directors of the City of Siloam Springs, 
as follows: 

Section 1: Section 6-2, Article I, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
amended to include the following definitions in alphabetical order: 

Disturbance means a breakdown of peaceful and law abiding behavior to include, but not be 
limited to, a fight, brawl or riot, or the commission of a criminal act. 

Premises means a defined location, structure or building, together with its land and outbuildings, 
occupied by a business and utilized in the pursuit of its interest, but excluding those areas used 
solely as a private residence. Provided that nothing in this code shall authorize sale, dispensing or 
consumption of alcoholic beverages on premises more broadly defined than authorized or licensed 
by the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division. 

Section 2: Section 6-4, Article I, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 6-4. - Application for permits. 
(a) Application for a permit required by this chapter shall be in writing on a fonn prescribed 

by the city and shall be accompanied by the required fee and a copy of the applicant's 
state permit. No city permit will be issued until applicant has received a state permit. 

(b) It shall be unlawful for any person to make any false statement or representation in any 
application required by this chapter or to give any false answer to any question contained 
therein. 

(c) An application shall identify all members having ownership of a co-partnership seeking a 
pennit under this section. 

(d) Permits required by this chapter shall be issued in such a manner that they will run for 
such length of time as the state permit. Annual pennit renewal fees shall be due and 
payable prior to the initial opening of the business, and thereafter on September 15 of 

Page l of9 



each year for the succeeding year. Late fees shall be imposed at the same rates and in the 
same manner as for business privilege licenses, as provided at section 22-33 of this Code. 

( e) The city will not issue or renew any permits pursuant to this chapter until all outstanding 
hotel, motel, and restaurant taxes and/or supplemental beverage taxes, if applicable, are 
paid. 

(f) No new permit shall be granted to any person to engage in the sale of liquor at retail, for 
consumption off the premises, for any business situated within 1,000 feet of any church 
or school. The distance shall be measured from the nearest point of the church or school 
building to the nearest point of the building to be permitted. 

(g) No new permits shall be granted to any person to engage in the business of manufacturing, 
transporting, storing, handling, receiving, distributing, selling, or dispensing, either at 
wholesale or retail, any controlled beverage, for any business situated within 200 feet of 
any church or school building. The distance shall be measured from the nearest point of 
the church or school building to the nearest point of the building to be permitted. The 
distance requirement shall not apply to businesses located in the H-lDT (Historic 
Downtown) Overlay District. 

(h) No permit shall be issued to: 
(1) A person who has been convicted of, or plead guilty or nolo contendere to, a felony; 
(2) A person under the age of twenty-one (21) years; 
(3) A person who is not a citizen or resident alien of the United States; 
( 4) A copartnership, unless all members of such copartnership are citizens or resident 

aliens of the United States; 
(5) A person who shall have had his or her permit issued under this Code revoked for cause 

or who has been convicted of a violation of this Code until the expiration of two (2) 
years from the date of such revocation or conviction; or 

( 6) A corporation or copartnership, if any of its officers or members have been convicted of 
a violation of this Code, have had a permit issued under this Code revoked for cause 
until two (2) years from the date of the conviction or revocation, or who have been 
convicted of, or plead guilty or nolo contendere to a felony. 

(7) Any person or entity not in possession of a valid City business license. 
(i) All permits issued by the city pursuant to this chapter shall be prominently displayed on 

the permitted premises by the permittee in the same manner as required by the state for 
state permits. 

(j) In order to determine an applicant's suitability for a permit, the applicant, or in the case 
of a copartnership, its members shall submit to a local criminal background check 
through the city's police department. The applicant(s) shall sign a release that allows the 
police department to divulge the results of all criminal background checks to the city 
administrator or his/her designee. 

(k) When any state permit is revoked by the state or required to be returned to the state for 
any reason, the city permit shall be returned to the city. The city will restore the permit 
upon proof that the state permit has been restored to the applicant, provided that no 
reclaimed permit will be restored to an applicant until all outstanding hotel, motel, and 
restaurant taxes and/or supplemental beverages taxes, if applicable, are paid. 

(1) All fees, taxes, and penalties received by the city pursuant to this chapter shall be 
deposited to the credit of general fund revenues. 

Page 2 of9 



(m) Permits shall not be transferable or assignable except as provided by A.C.A. § 3-4-103A 
(Fiduciaries - Continuation of permitted business). 

(n) Pennits issued by the city shall contain, in addition to any further infonnation or material 
to be prescribed by the rules and regulations of the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division, 
the following: 
( 1) The name of the person to whom the permit is issued; 
(2) The type of permit; 
(3) A description by street and number, or otherwise, of the permitted premises; 
(4) A statement in substance that the permit shall not be deemed a property or vested 

right and that it may be revoked at any time pursuant to law; 
(5) The name and address of the owner of the premises. Upon a change in the 

ownership, the permittee or the new owner may file notice to that effect in writing 
with the city on forms to be provided by the city for that purpose. 

Section 3: Section 6-6, Article I, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 6-6. - Prohibited activities/warning notice. 
(a) Any person to which a controlled beverage permit has been issued shall comply with all 

laws and regulations of the State of Arkansas, the Alcoholic Beverage Control Division of 
the State of Arkansas, and the City of Siloam Springs regarding the control and regulation 
of controlled beverages, including but not limited to the following: 
(1) Purchase by or for minors, sale to minors, or handling by minors prohibited. 

a. It shall be unlawful for any person under the age of 21 years to have in his 
or her possession, to purchase or attempt to purchase, or otherwise obtain 
any controlled beverages. However, this provision shall not apply to 
beverages served by members of one's family or to the use of wine in any 
religious ceremony or rite in any established church or religion. 

b. It shall be unlawful for any person to, knowingly or unknowingly, purchase 
on behalf of, furnish to, give away to, or otherwise dispose of to any person 
under the age of21 years any controlled beverages; however, this provision 
shall not apply to the serving of such to members of one's family or to the 
use of wine in any religious ceremony or rite in any established church or 
religion. 

c. It shall be unlawful for any person engaged in the business of 
manufacturing, distributing or selling, at wholesale or retail, any controlled 
beverages to sell, offer for sale, or give away, under any conditions, any 
such controlled beverages to any person under the age of 21 years. The 
burden of determining the age of any person shall be upon the seller. 

d. It shall be unlawful for any wholesaler, retailer, or transporter of controlled 
beverages to allow any employee or other person under the age of 21 years 
of age to have anything whatsoever to do with the sale, transporting or 
handling of controlled beverages. However, with the written consent of a 
parent or guardian, persons 18 years of age and older may be employed by 
licensed liquor and beer wholesalers and by licensed native wineries to 

Page 3 of9 



handle controlled beverages at the place of business of the licensed 
wholesaler or wineries. 

(2) A warning notice regarding the sale to, possession or purchase by, or furnishing to 
minors of controlled beverages shall be posted in a conspicuous place in public 
view in each place of business where controlled beverages are sold, served or 
dispensed, including all drive up windows. The warning notices shall be of the size, 
have the content, and be posted in the manner as prescribed by the Arkansas 
Alcoholic Beverage Control Division. 

(b) Except where otherwise expressly authorized under the laws of the State of Arkansas, no 
establishment selling controlled beverages, including beer and small farm wine, may sell 
or otherwise distribute controlled beverages through drive-up windows. Any premises 
licensed for controlled beverage sales that maintains or operates a drive-up window for 
sales of food or other merchandise must post a notice not less than three inches by five 
inches, clearly affixed to the drive up window and clearly visible to patrons thereof, stating 
"NO ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES SOLD THROUGH THIS DRIVE UP WINDOW." The 
same notice must also be posted on the interior of the permitted outlet so as to be clearly 
visible to employees selling items, through the drive up window. 

(c) No permittee for the sale or dispensing of alcoholic beverages for on-premises 
consumption including private club licenses shall suffer or permit any person to appear on 
the licensed premises in such manner or attire as to expose to view any portion of the pubic 
area, anus, vulva, or genitals or any simulation thereof, nor suffer or permit any female to 
appear on the premises in such manner or attire as to expose to view any portion of her 
breast below the top of the areola or any simulation thereof. 

(d) That no person shall bring into or consume or allow to be brought into or allow to be 
consumed intoxicants or alcoholic beverages of any kind, in any commercial establishment, 
or business, which suffers or permits any person to appear on the premises in such manner 
or attire as to expose to view any portion of the pubic area, anus, vulva, or genitals or any 
simulation thereof, or suffers or permits any female to appear on the premises in such 
manner or attire as to expose to view any portion of her breast below the top of the areola 
or any simulation thereof. 

(e) It shall be unlawful for any permittee to willfully permit any disturbance or unlawful or 
disorderly act or conduct to be committed by any person or group of persons upon any 
premises permitted for the sale of controlled beverages. 

(f) It shall be unlawful for any permittee, in any manner to encourage or participate in any 
disturbance or unlawful or disorderly act or conduct upon any premise permitted for the 
sale of controlled beverages. However, such person engaged in the sale of controlled 
beverages may use such lawful means as may be proper to protect his person or property 
from damage or injury. 

(g) Permittees, or their managers on duty, shall promptly report any disturbance on the 
premises 

(h) It shall be unlawful for any permittee to not post and keep at all times visible to the public, 
in a conspicuous place on the premises, a sign to be furnished by the city , which sign shall 
be in the following form: "WARNING - THE CITY OF SILOAM SPRINGS POLICE 
DEPARTMENT MUST BE NOTIFIED OF ALL DISTURBANCES IN THIS 
ESTABLISHMENT". 

Page 4 of9 



(i) If any permittee shall conduct his place of business in a manner as to constitute a nuisance, 
the city administrator, subject to appeal to the board of directors, shall revoke the license 
of such person to sell controlled beverages in the city. 

(j) Any person violating any provision of this ordinance shall be subject to the general 
penalties as set out in section 1-7 of the Code of Siloam Springs. 

Section 4: Subsections 6-7(1) through 6-7(9), Article I, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal 
Code are hereby renumbered as Subsections 6-7(a) through 6-7(i). 

Section 5: Section 6-11, Article I, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
deleted in its entirety. 

Section 6: Sections 6-11 through 6-15, Article I, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code 
are hereby reserved. 

Section 7: Subsection 6-l 7(c), Article II, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 

(c) General. Any person, except as provided in subsections (a) and (b) above, who sells, serves, 
barters, exchanges, or gives away controlled beverages, except wine, for consumption on­
or off-premise without having a valid city permit as provided in this chapter shall, upon 
conviction, be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and shall be fined not more than $500.00. 
Each day of such operation without a valid city permit shall constitute a separate and 
distinct offense. Provided, however, that these provisions shall not be construed to require 
a license of any lawful occupant in their private residence to serve alcohol, without charge, 
to family or guests. 

Section 8: Section 6-19, Article II, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 6-19. - Suspension or Revocation. 
(a) The city administrator may, upon his own complaint or that of any law enforcement officer 

or agency having jurisdiction over the permitted premises, suspend, cancel or revoke any 
permit granted under this chapter if the permit granted to such permittee by the state is 
suspended, canceled or revoked respectively for any reason, or if the permittee is convicted 
of any violation of applicable state law, or is guilty of any of the other acts or omissions 
listed as causes under A.C.A. § 3-9-235(b), as grounds for revoking a state permit. 

(b) The city administrator may, for any other lawful reason, suspend for a period not to exceed 
six months or revoke the permit of any permittee violating this chapter after due notice to 
the permittee and an opportunity for the permittee to be heard. 

(c) The proceedings shall be in accordance with rules and regulations established by the city 
administrator and not inconsistent with law. However, the city administrator shall not be 
bound by the legal rules of evidence in conducting hearings and in making his or her 
decisions and may take into consideration any testimony, papers, or documents which he 
or she may deem relevant to the issue. 

Page 5 of9 



( d) When any permit is revoked, no new permit shall be issued to the same person, partnership 
or corporation within one year of such revocation. 

Section 9: Sections 6-20 and 6-21 , Article II, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Spring Municipal Code are 
hereby enacted to read as follows: 

6-20. - Statement of causes of suspension or revocation of city controlled beverage permit. 
(a) There shall be printed and furnished by the City to each permittee a statement of the causes 

for which controlled beverage permits may be suspended or revoked. 
(b) The statement shall be prepared by the city administrator or their designee and delivered 

to the permittee as soon as may be practicable thereafter. 
( c) Any amendments therein shall also be sent by the city administrator or their designee to all 

pennittees as soon as may be practicable after the amendment. 
(d) Failure to send the statement or changes therein, or failure to receive them, or any 

misstatement or error contained in the statement or amendments shall, however, not be an 
excuse or justification for any violation or remit or decrease any penalty or forfeiture 
therefor. 

(e) Within three (3) days after a permit shall have been suspended or revoked, notice thereof 
shall be given to the permittee by mailing the notice addressed to him or her at the premises 
permitted. 

(f) Notice shall also be mailed to the owner of the premises permitted. 
(g) The holder of the permit shall thereupon surrender the permit to the city administrator or 

his/her designee. 
(h) The mailing of the permit by the permittee to the city administrator or his/her designee by 

registered mail or insured parcel post shall be deemed sufficient compliance with this 
prov1s1on. 

(i) The city administrator, immediately upon notice of suspension or revocation, shall serve a 
written notice thereof upon to the police chief and the city clerk. 
(1) This notice shall identify the permit number of the suspended permit, and state the 

name and place of residence of the holder, the location of the permitted premises, 
and the date when the pennit was suspended or revoked. In the case of a 
suspension, the notice shall include the dates of the suspension. 

(2) In case the pennit is not immediately surrendered, the city administrator shall issue 
a written demand for the surrender of the permit and deliver the demand to the 
police chief. The police chief or their designee shall immediately take possession 
of the permit and return the permit to the city administrator or his/her designee. 

6-21. Acts Resulting in Revocation or Suspension of City Controlled Beverage License: 
(a) The prohibited acts identified in section 6-6 of this chapter and reasons for suspension or 

revocation of a pennit identified in section 6-19 notwithstanding, the following acts on the 
part of any pennittee or their employees are violations which may result in the suspension 
of the pennittee's city controlled beverage pennit for a period up to 30 days: 
(I) Sale of controlled beverages when the permit is not posted; 
(2) Failure to maintain health, safety, and sanitary standards; 
(3) Consuming, or under the influence of, a controlled beverage while on duty; 

Page 6 of9 



( 4) Failure to surrender a permit when the business has been voluntarily inoperative for 
over thirty (30) days; 

(5) Use of an unlabeled dispensing faucet; 
(6) Allowing prostitutes to frequent the premises; 
(7) Allowing immoral conduct on the premises; 
(8) Negligently selling to users of narcotics; 
(9) Delivery of controlled beverages by a retailer away from his or her permitted 

premises; 
(10) Sale of controlled beverages in a container or of a size other than approved by the 

Arkansas Beverage Control Division for such use; 
( 11) Misrepresentation of a brand, or keeping beverages in an unauthorized container, 

or refilling, diluting, or failing to destroy empty bottles; 
(12) Failure to maintain membership books or properly maintain guest books by a 

private club; 
(13) Allowing an unauthorized guest in a private club; 
(14) Dispensing to nonmembers or non-guests by a private club; 
(15) Unauthorized purchasing by a private club from other than a retailer; 
(16) Failure to maintain financial records; 

(b) The prohibited acts identified in section 6-6 of this chapter and reasons for suspension or 
revocation of a permit identified in section 6-19 notwithstanding, the following acts on the 
part of any permittee or their employees are violations which may results in the suspension 
of the permittee's city controlled beverage permit for a period up to 90 days: 
(1) Defacing, destroying, or altering a permit; 
(2) Manufacturing, selling, offering, dispensing, or giving away, possessmg, or 

transporting controlled beverages upon which tax is not paid; 
(3) Failure to maintain proper records by a manufacturer; 
( 4) Selling to any person the permittee knows or has reasonable cause to believe is 

acquiring the controlled beverages for the purpose of illegal sale or other prohibited 
disposition (bootlegging); 

(5) Accepting food stamps in payment for controlled beverages; 
(6) Sale of controlled beverages by vending machine. 

(c) The prohibited acts identified in section 6-6 of this chapter and reasons for suspension or 
revocation of a permit identified in section 6-19 notwithstanding, the following acts on the 
part of any permittee or their employees are violations which may results in the suspension 
of the permittee's city controlled beverage permit for a period up to 120 days: 
(1) Failure to furnish access to premises by any law enforcement officer or any 

authorized Alcoholic Beverage Control Division personnel or failure to cooperate 
or take reasonable action to assist any such law enforcement officers or authorized 
division personnel who are on the permitted premises in the performance of their 
duties; 

(2) Failure to allow inspection of books or records; 
(3) Posting permit on unauthorized premises; 
( 4) Manufacture or possession of controlled beverage with excess alcoholic content; 
(5) The permittee possessed or knew or reasonably should have known that any agent 

or employee or patron of the establishment possessed, used, sold or produced on 
the permitted premises any illegal drug or narcotic or controlled substance or that 

Page 7 of 9 



any agent or employee while acting on the permittee's behalf knowingly allowed 
the possession, use, sale or production on the permitted premises of any illegal drug 
or narcotic or controlled substance; 

(6) Selling or allowing the consumption of alcoholic beverages on the pem1itted 
premises when the permit is suspended or on inactive status; 

(7) Selling to minors; 
(8) Unauthorized employment of a minor; 
(9) Disorderly conduct or a breach of the peace by a patron or employee on the 

permitted premises. Disorderly conduct includes without limitation a fight, brawl, 
or disturbance that results in bodily injury to a person on the permitted premises; 

(10) Selling to an intoxicated person; 
(11) Unauthorized manufacturing, selling, offering, dispensing, or giving away of 

controlled beverages; 
(12) Conducting or permitting gambling on premises, not including bingo and raffles 

allowed in AC.A. § 23-114-101 Charitable Bingo and Raffles Enabling Act, or a 
lottery allowed in A.C.A. § 23-115-101 Arkansas Scholarship Lottery Act; 

(13) Violation oflegal closing hours; 
(14) Possession of a weapon on the permitted premises by a person without a possessory 

or proprietary interest in the permitted premises, unless otherwise authorized by 
law. 

Section 10: Section 6-31 (j), Article III, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 

(j) Special event alcohol permit. Authorizes any person, 21 years of age or older and not 
otherwise prohibited by the laws of the State of Arkansas or the United States, to purchase 
a permit authorizing the dispensing of controlled beverages for consumption on private 
premises that are not otherwise licensed for such distribution by the City of Siloam Springs. 
Said permit shall be subject to the following conditions: 

a. Application for said permit must be made no less than 15 days in advance. 
b. Said permit shall be good for the hours of 10:00 a.m . to 12:00 midnight 

during one 24-hour period designated by the applicant. 
c. Said pennit shall not authorize the dispensing of any controlled beverages 

on city property, or any other location prohibited by law, including within 
applicable distances from church or school buildings. 

d. No person or entity may obtain more than six special event alcohol permits 
during any given calendar year. 

e. The city reserves the right to deny any request for a special event alcohol 
permit if, in the opinion of the city administrator, fire chief, chief of police 
or any public health official, such permit would be detrimental to public 
health, safety or welfare. 

(1) Permit fee. The special event alcohol permit fee shall be $25.00, payable at the time 
of application. 

(2) Hours of operation. It shall be unlawful for the holder of any special event alcohol 
permit, or their agent or employee, to serve or permit the consumption of any 
controlled beverages on the permitted premises outside of the hours set forth in the 

Page 8 of9 



permit, or during any 24-hour interval designated an emergency period by the 
mayor, board of directors, or any person acting in the mayor's or the board of 
director's capacity. 

Section 11: Section 6-31 (k), Article III, Chapter 6 of the Siloam Springs Municipal Code is hereby 
amended to read as follows, subsections 6-31 (k)a through 6-31 (k)d, and 6-31 (k)(l) and 6-31 (k)(2) 
remain unchanged: 

(k) Microbrewery permit. Authorizes an establishment, with appropriate state licenses, to 
operate a microbrewery which shall manufacture one or more varieties of beer or malt 
beverage in an aggregate quantity not to exceed 5,000 barrels per year and to store any 
such beer or malt beverage and any other beer or malt beverage which the microbrewery­
restaurant licensee may purchase from wholesalers licensed by this state on the 
microbrewery-restaurant licensed premises. The establishment holding said permit may 
also: 

Section 12: Repealer and severability. 
P1ior Ordinances in conflict with the provisions enacted herein are repealed to the extent of the 
conflict as of the effective date of this Ordinance. If any provision of a section of this Ordinance 
or the application thereof to any person or circumstance is held invalid, the invalidity does not 
affect the other provisions or applications of the section or related sections which can be given 
effect without the invalid provision or application, and to this end the provisions are severable. 

ORDAINED AND ENACTED this day of , 2016. 
~~- -~~~~~~~~~~~-

(SEAL) 
ATTEST: 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 

APPROVED: 

John Mark Turner, Mayor 

Page 9 of9 



-• .;t:;::·. -i'~· '.I - - - - - • " - - --

TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

siloam s 1n - - p ,_}gs 
Its a 1 ullural. 

STAFF REPORT 

Mayor and Board of Directors 
Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
January 12, 2016 
Ordinance 16-02 I 1st Reading I Amend Article VI, Division 1 of the Municipal Code I 
Preference Among Municipal Bidders 

Recommendation: Approval of Ordinance No. 16-02 providing a five percent (5%) preference to local 
resident bidders, up to a maximum of $500. 

Background: In 2015, the Arkansas General Assembly passed Act 1059 which pem1its cities to grant a 
bidding preference of up to five percent (5%) to firms residing within the city limits. This preference 
will allow the City to purchase from local businesses even if they are not the lowest bidder or have the 
lowest quote. Studies have shown that spending in one' s local community produces economic benefits 
for that community. Some studies indicated that the benefit is two-fold, while others have shown that 
the economic benefit is three times as much. One study found that the local businesses return an 
average of 52 percent of their revenue to the local economy. For these reasons, staff recommends 
approval of Ordinance No. 16-02. 

Fiscal Impact: The financial impact of this ordinance may result in increases of up to $500 on certain 
purchases. However, it is anticipated that any such increase will produce additional economic benefits 
for the community as a whole. 

Attachments: 
Ordinance No. 16-02 

- - - -

P.O. Rox 80 • Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • W\\'W.siloamsprings.com 

- - - -



ORDINANCE NO. 16-02 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ARTICLE VI, DIVISION 1 OF THE 
SILOAM SPRINGS MUNICIPAL CODE TO ADD SECTION 2-227 
REGARDING A PREFERENCE FOR MUNICIPAL BIDDERS 

WHEREAS, Act 1059 of the 2015 Arkansas General Assembly created a new statute, codified at AC.A. 
~ 14-58-105. which allows the City to grant a bidding preference to a firm residing within its city limits; 
and 

WHEREAS, in order to support and encourage the growth and sustainability of local businesses, it is in 
the best interests of the citizens of the City of Siloam Springs, Arkansas, that Section 2-227 be added to the 
Code of Ordinances of the City of Siloam Springs to grant the bidding preference authorized by Act 1059 
of the 2015 Arkansas General Assembly. Now Therefore: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CITY OF SILOAM 
SPRINGS, ARKANSAS, THAT: 

The Siloam Springs Municipal Code is amended to add Section 2-227 to read as follows: 

Section 2-227. Preference among municipal bidders. 

(a) The following words and phrases shall for the purpose of this section have the following 
meanings: 

Commodities means all property, including without limitation, equipment, printing, 
stationery, supplies (to the extent not purchased pursuant to section 2-182( d)), and capital 
improvements, but excluding leases on real property, real properiy, or a permanent interest in real 
property, and exempt commodities and services; 

Firm residellt in the cizv means any individual, partnership, association, or corporation, 
whether domestic or foreign, that: 

( l) Maintains at least one (1) staffed place of business located within the corporate 
limits of the city; 

(2) For not less than two (2) successive years immediately before submitting a bid, 
has paid taxes to the county that benefit the city on either real or personal property 
used or intended to be used in connection with the finn's business; and, 

(3) Has a valid business registration/license with the city. 

Lmi·est q11a/{fied bid means the lowest bid that confonns to the specifications and request 
for bids. 

City means the City of Siloam Springs. 

Non resident.firm means a firm that is not included in the definition of a finn resident in 
the city. 

Services means labor, time, or effort furnished by a contractor. 

(b) In the purchase of commodities or services by competitive bidding. a reference of five percent 
(5%) shall be granted to the lowest qualified bid for a bidder that qualifies as a finn resident in 
the city. 

(I) The maximum monetary amount of any preference granted. regardless of the bid amount 

Page 1 of2 



or percentage of preference, shall be Five Hundred Dollars ($500.00). 

(2) In calculating the preference to be allowed, the total amount of each bid of each finn 
resident in the city who claims the preference shall be reduced by five percent (5%), up 
to the maximum allowed as described above, from the total amount of each bid. 

(3) If after making the deduction, the bid of any firm resident in the city claiming the 
preference is lower than the bid of the nonresident fim1, then the award shall be made to 
the firm resident in the city that submitted the lowest qualified bid, whether or not that 
particular finn resident in the city claimed the preference. 

( c) The preference provided for in this section only applies in comparing bids when one ( 1) or more 
bids are by a firm resident in the city and the other bid or bids are by a nonresident firm. 

( 1) The preference provided for in this section does not apply to competing bids of fim1 
residents in the city after preferential rejection of the bids of nonresident finns, nor to 
the situation where all bidders are firm residents in the city. 

(d) If any provision or condition of this section conflicts with any provision of federal or state law 
or any rule or regulation made under federal or state law pertaining to federal grants-in-aid 
programs or other federal or state aid programs, the provision or condition shall not apply to the 
state-supported or federal-supported contracts for the purchase of commodities or services to the 
extent that the conflict exists. However, all provisions or conditions of this section with which 
there is no conflict apply to contracts to purchase commodities or services to be paid, in whole 
or in part, from federal funds. 

(e) The provisions of this section shall apply, without limitation, to public works projects, capital 
improvements, commodities, materials, equipment, and services procured by the city. 

(f) When circumstances arise to which this section and Ark. Stat. Ann. § 19-11- 259 (regarding 
preferences among bidders) apply, both the preference provided under this section and the 
preference provided under Ark. Stat. Ann. § 19-11-259 shall also apply. 

(g) To the extent that federal purchasing laws or bidding preferences conflict, this section does not 
apply to projects related to supplying water or wastewater utility services, operations, or 
maintenance to a federal military installation by a municipality of the state. 

Ordained and Enacted this ___ day of ___ _________ 2016. 

ATTEST: APPROVED: 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk John Mark Turner, Mayor 

(SEAL) 

Page 2 of2 



To: 
From: 
Date: 
Subject: 

siloam. s !1 • QS -- P~. 
Tt'r 11. 111lf.1.mil 

STAFF REPORT 

Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
Don Clark, Community Services Director 
January 12, 2015 
Ordinance No. 16-03 I Amending Section 74-72 of the Municipal Code to revise 
the Family Aquatic Center rates. 

I Recommendation: Approve of Ordinance No. 16-03 Family Aquatic Center Rates 

Background: The Parks and Recreation Department is proposing a revision be made to the 
season membership rate schedule. In an attempt to address patron complaints and concerns and 
to avoid discrepancies between the Parks and Recreation office and the Family Aquatic Center, 
a simplified and consistent enrollment policy and fee schedule is needed. 

Issuing season passes based on a household rather than a family and including a 4-person cap will 
address the following inconsistencies: 

I. Capping the number of members per pass to four and charging $15 for additional members 
will provide a more consistent schedule for patrons and staff. i.e. The current cost of a 6 
plus family member pass is $175. Families of 10 members are paying $17.50 per member, 
where as a family of three is paying $50 per member (the price of up to 4 members) . 

2. Include care givers on memberships. The City currently does not pem1it grandparents and 
child care givers to be listed on family memberships. 

3. Discontinue the April 10% discount. 
4. Discontinue the two out of school district rates and include one for out of school district. 
5. Requiring proof of residency may be needed to determine the out of school district 

rates. 
6. Discontinue the one-time out-of-town relative free admittance. 

Fiscal Impact: 
Attachments: 

There will be a minimal fiscal impact to the City. 
Current Family Aquatic Center rate schedule; 
Proposed Family Aquatic Center rate schedule; and 
Ordinance No. 16-03 

- - -

P.O. Box 80 •Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • www.siloamsprings.com 

~ - - -



EXISTING FAMILY AQUATIC CENTER RATES 

Opening Day - May 23, 2015 

Annual Membership Passes 

10% discount if purchased during the month of April. 

NON-RESIDENT NON-RESIDENT 
NUMBER OF RESIDENT WITHIN SCHOOL OUT OF SCHOOL 
MEMBERS DISTRICT DISTRICT 

INDIVIDUAL 

UP TO FOUR 

FIVE 

SIX OR MORE 

Daily Admission Fee 

Age 4 and up $4.00 

Age 3 and under $3.00 

REGULAR 

$75.00 

$150.00 

$165.00 

$175.00 

DISCOUNTED REGULAR DISCOUNTED REGULAR 

$67.50 $105.00 $94.50 $115.00 

$135.00 $165.00 $148.50 $175.00 

$148.50 $180.00 $162.00 $190.00 

$157.50 $190.00 $171.00 $200.00 

Children under the age of ten must be accompanied by a parent or authorized guardian. 

Large Group Rental 

DISCOUNTED 

$103.50 

$157.50 

$171.00 

$180.00 

Groups up to 550 people may rent the Family Aquatic Center for their exclusive use during evening hours 

when the Center is not open to the public. Rental must be reserved at least two weeks in advance. 

Security Deposit: $250.00 

Rental Fee: $250.00 per hour 

Swim Lessons 

Classes for all ages are $35.00 per person per session (one session consists of eight SO-minute lessons). 

Session 1 June gth - 18th Classes meet mornings Monday through Thursday each week 

June gth - 24th Classes meet Monday, Wednesday and Friday evenings 

Session 2 July 61h - 16th 
July 6th - 22nd 

Classes meet mornings Monday through Thursday each week 

Classes meet Monday, Wednesday and Friday evenings 

Morning classes begin at 9:30 and 10:30 I Evening classes begin at 6:30 and 7 :30. 



PROPOSED FAMILY AQUATIC CENTER RATES 

Opening Day - May 28, 2016 

Annual Season Passes 

RESIDENT OUT OF SCHOOL DISTRICT 

$135 
Up to 4 household members; 

$165 
Up to 4 household members; 

$15 Each additional member $15 Each additional member 

$60 
Youth Pass 

$90 
Youth Pass 

15 Years of age or younger 15 Years of age or younger 

$60 Senior Pass $90 Senior Pass 

$70 Adult Pass $100 Adult Pass 

Member benefits: 

o Unlimited access to the FAC during normal business hours 
o Member's Only Window: No waiting in line 
o Members only swim: Saturday mornings from 10:00 AM to noon 
o Dive in Movie August 12th, 9-11 PM. Free with membership 

Daily Admission Fee 

Age 4 and up $4.00 
Age 3 and under $3.00 Children under the age of ten must be accompanied by a parent or authorized guardian. 

Large Group Rental 

Groups up to 550 people may rent the Family Aquatic Center for their exclusive use during evening hours 

when the Center is not open to the public. Rental must be reserved at least two weeks in advance. 

Security Deposit: $250.00 Rental Fee: $250.00 per hour 

Swim Lessons 

Classes for all ages are $35.00 per person per session (one session consists of eight SO-minute lessons). 

Session 1 June 13 - 23 
June 13 -29 

Session 2 July 11- 21 
July 11- 27 

Classes meet mornings Monday through Thursday each week at 9:30 and 10:30 
Classes meet Monday, Wednesday and Friday evenings at 6:30 and 7:30 

Classes meet mornings Monday through Thursday each week 9:30 and 10:30 
Classes meet Monday, Wednesday and Friday evenings at 6:30 and 7:30 

PLEASE CONTACT THE PARKS AND RECREATION OFFICE FOR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION 
120 South Mt. Olive - (479} 524-5779 - parks@siloamsprings.com 



ORDINANCE NO. 16-03 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTION 74-72(a) OF 
THE SILOAM SPRINGS MUNICIPAL CODE; 

REVISING RATES FOR THE FAMILY AQUATIC 

CENTER. 

WHEREAS, City staff has reviewed the governing ordinance for the Family Aquatic 

Center and has identified revisions to improve efficiency and simplify the pricing and 

purchasing process for consumers; and 

WHEREAS, the Family Aquatic Center membership fee schedule includes separate 

rates for residents, non-residents within the school district and non-residents out of 

school district; and 

WHEREAS, a ten percent discount is applied to annual memberships purchased in the month 
of April; and 

WHEREAS, to reduce confusion by the public and simplify sales and accounting 

procedures, usage fees for the Family Aquatic Center should be adjusted to 

discontinue the non-resident in school district rates and the ten percent discounted rate 

for memberships purchased during the month of April; and 

WHEREAS, annual group memberships are cun-ently based on family units; and 

WHEREAS, in order to accommodate a greater variety ofliving anangements, that 

annual memberships should be issued based on households rather than family units; 

Now Therefore: 

Be It Enacted, by the Board of Directors of the City of Siloam Springs, as follows: 

SECTION I. 

THAT Chapter 74-72(a) of the City Code ("Policies and Procedures for Facility Use") is hereby 
amended as follows (added terms are underlined, deleted terms are struck through: 

Sec. 74-72. Policies and procedures. 

(a) Family Aquatic Center. 

(I) General policy and authori(v. Fees and memberships shall be instituted to offset 
the cost of operating the city's Family Aquatic Center. The Family Aquatic 
Center is available for use by various groups and organizations for swimming 
activities. 



(2) Requirements.for rental. Individuals and groups must contact the parks and 
recreation depai1ment at least two weeks prior to the date which they wish to 
reserve the Family Aquatic Center or receive a group discount and enter into a 
rental agreement which must be approved in writing by the parks and recreation 
department. 

(3) Fees and deposits. All deposits collected will be deposited with the city 
administrator or his designee. A refund check will be issued within two weeks 
after the event. The following schedule will be in effect for admission to the 
Family Aquatic Center: 

a. Annual Siloam Springs Sc/zoo! District resident memberships.­
Memberships are aYailable to city residents only at a ten percent discount 
on the following fees if the membership is purchased between April 1 and 
April 30: 

1. Annual resident family household membership (family of four) (up to 4 
household members) ... $125.00 $135.00 

2. Fifth family member ... 15.00 Each additional member $15.00 

3. Sixth family member (or more) ... 10.00 

4. Maximum cost .. . 150.00 

5. Annual resident individual membership ... 75.00 

6. Youth Pass (15 years of age and younger) ... $60 

7. Senior Pass ... $60 

8. Adult Pass . . . $70 

b. lwmresident memberships (~f"t!ze city school d-istrict. Memberships shall also be 
available to nonresidents of the city who are members of the city school district as 
follows: 

1. Annual nonresident family membership (family of four) ... $135 .00 
$165.00 

2. Fifth family member . .. 15.00 

3. Sixth family member (or more) ... 10.00 

4. Maximum cost ... 160.00 

4. Annual nonresident individual membership ... 105.00 



c. Nonresid-ent membersMps Outside the ci~v school district memberships. 
Memberships shall also be available to nonresidents of the city from persons residing 
outside of the city school district as follows: 

1. Annual nonresident out of school district family membership 

(family of four) ... $175.00 (Up to 4 household members) $165 .00 

2. 2. Fifth family member ... 15.00 Each additional member $15 

3. Sixth family member (or more) ... 10.00 

4. Annual nonresident individual membership ... 115.00 

5. Youth Pass (15 years of age and younger) . . . $90 

6. Senior Pass ... $90 

7. Adult Pass ... $100 

d. Dai~v admission fee. Daily admission fees shall be as follows: 

1. Age 4 and Up .... $4.00 

2. Age 3 and Under .... 3.00 

e. Slide fee. All day is included in membership and daily admission. 

f Large group rental. The "large group rental" fees are as follows: 

1. Groups to 550 may rent the Family Aquatic Center for their exclusive use 
during evening hours when the center is not open to the public. 

2. Rental fee will be $250.00 per hour with a security deposit of $250.00. 

3. Large groups must rent the facility at least two weeks in advance. 

g. Annual CPI adjustment. Unless otherwise provided by the board of directors, 
beginning with the 20 I 5 season, and each year thereafter, rates shall be adjusted 
annually in accordance with the All Items Consumer Price Index for Urban 
Consumers (CPI-U), South Region, for the preceding year. The city administrator or 
his designee may, at their discretion, round such rates to the nearest plus or minus 
$1.00 increment. 

( 4) Children under the age of ten must be accompanied by a parent or authorized 
guardian. 

(No amendments are proposed for 74-72 sections (b) through ( d), which are omitted herein for 
brevity.) 



SECTION II . Repealer and severability. 

Prior Ordinances in conflict with the provisions enacted herein are repealed to the 

extent of the conflict as of the effective date of this Ordinance. If any provision of a 

section of this Ordinance or the application thereof to any person or circumstance is 

held invalid, the invalidity does not affect the other provisions or applications of the 

section or related sections which can be given effect without the invalid provision or 

application, and to this end the provisions are severable. 

ORDAINED AND ENACTED this ~ day of _ _ _____ 2016. 

APPROVED: 

ATTEST: 

John Mark Turner, Mayor 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 

(SEAL) 



siloam s 1-n [JS --- p_ __ ig 
ltS a nahnul 

STAFF REPORT 

TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

Board of Directors; Mayor; Phillip Patterson, City Administrator 
Christina Petriches, Finance Director 
01 /08/2016 
Resolution 03-16 I Referendum on City Contributions of Social Security for Part 
Time Employees 

Recommendation: Approval of Resolution 03-16 Calling for a Referendum on Social Security 
Benefits 

Background: We are currently paying social security on our part time employees; however, it 
was recently discovered that we have an agreement with the State of Arkansas dated 1951 that 
states we will not make these payments. Because our employees benefit from their participation 
in Social Security, we would like to offer them the opportunity to continue to participate. The 
State requires that we authorize a referendum in which they will determine whether the majority 
of part time employees desire to participate in Social Security. 

Fiscal Impact: Depending on the results of the referendum the City may pay less in payroll 
taxes of approximately $19,000. 

Attachment: Resolution 03-16 

-- -
· P.O. Rox 80 •Siloam Springs, AR 72761 • www.siloarnsprings.com 

- - - -



RESOLUTION NO. 03-16 

A RESOLUTION TO REQUEST AUTHORIZATION OF A REFERENDUM 

WHEREAS, it is the express purpose and intention of the City of Siloam Springs to extend to 
its part-time positions an opportunity to participate in full Social Security on as broad a basis as 
is pennitted under applicable State and Federal Law, and 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City of Siloam Springs is hereby 
authorized to make written request to the Arkansas State Social Security Administrator for 
authorization to hold a referendum to determine whether a majority of said employees desire 
full Social Security coverage effective January 1, 2016. 

Done and Resolved this 19th day of January 20 16. 

APPROVED: 

John Mark Turner, Mayor 

(SEAL) 

ATTEST: 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 

I hereby certify that this Resolution is a true and exact copy of the original adopted by the City 
Board of Directors on the 19th day of January 2016. 

Renea Ellis, City Clerk 


	Agenda
	Jan 5 Minutes
	BKD, LLC Auditors
	Library Change Order
	Ord 15-31
	Ord 15-32
	Ord 16-01
	Ord 16-02
	Ord 16-03
	Res 03-16

